Office of the Town Clerk
Diane M. Wilhelm

Registrar of Vital Statistics Records Management Officer Marriage Officer

TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Gabrielsen, Giglio,
Maryann Tague

FROM: Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk

DATE: November 25, 2014

RE: Open Bid Report for Paint 2014

3 bids were received and opened on November 25, 2014 at 2:05pm:
*See Attached

Home Depot

2455 Paces Ferry Rd
Atlanta GA 30339
866 689-0690

John Deere Landscapes
1385 E 36t St
Cleveland OH 44114
800 321-5325

Riverhead Building Supply
250 David Court

Calverton NY 11933

631 599-8070



AIN WHITE #A89w

ANLE
LLONS

See attached quote

7 | ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. GALLONS
COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL sheet for all products
Home Depot is
3 | OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS- | GALLONS providing pricing on -
BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL in the same order as
4 | EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- | GALLONS this page. Attached
BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL list contains links to
the MSDS sheets.
5 | ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. GALLONS The attached store
COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL quote 1211-424169
6 | ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR GALLONS has additional
APPROVED EQUAL information per
product
7 | ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX — ASST. GALLONS
COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL
8 | ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS — ASST. COLORS- BM GALLONS
333 OR APPROVED EQUAL
9 | ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS — ASST. COLORS-BM- | GALLONS
207 OR APPROVED EQUAL
10| INTERIOR VINYL LATEX — FLAT- BM 275 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
71| INTERIOR VINLY LATEX — GLOSS- BM 276 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
12 | EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX — FLAT- BM-171 OR GALLONS
QPPROVED EQUAL
13 | EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX — SEMI-GLOSS- BM-170 OR | GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
14 | EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX — GLOSS- BM M 28 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
15 | MASONRY ENAMEL — GLOSS- BM M22 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
76 | PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
77 | EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
18 | WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, GALLONS
THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED
EQUAL
19 | FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. GALLONS
CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL
20 | AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS GALLONS
21 | SPRAY — ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ/CAN 11.5)5 | GALLONS
STAR
22 | RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X GALLONS
ZABIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx 9




See attached quote
sheet for all products

23 | NEW METAL PRIMER GALLONS .
Home Depot is
providing pricing on -
24 RUSTOLEUM — ASST. COLORS GALLONS in the same order as
this page. Attached
WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS GALLONS list contains links to
- the MSDS sheets.
The attached store
25 | C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS quote 1211-424169
has additional
26 | THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL — CLEAR OR APPROVED | GALLONS information per
EQUAL product
27 | WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), GALLONS
WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL
28 | THOMPSON WATER SEAL — SOLID COLORS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
29 | THOMPSON WATER SEAL — SEMI-GLOSS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
30 | MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, GALLONS
(ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL
31 MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
32 | MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
33 | MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
PAINT PRODUCTS GALLONS
34 | MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
35 | VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
36 | VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
37 | VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
38 | VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL | GALLONS
39 | PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR 5 GALLON
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS
40 | PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE 1 GALLON
EGGSHELL CANS
41 PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR 1 GALLON
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS
42 | PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL) | 5 GALLON
CANS

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx

10




At S0 b
PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)

43 1 GALLON
CANS

44 | 2 PART EPOXY A GALLONS

45 | 2 PART EXPOXY B GALLONS

46 | AQUAPON 09/3/01 ( OR APPROVED EQUAL) GALLONS

47 | AQUAPON 98-98/017 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED | GALLONS
EQUAL)

48 | LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES | GALLONS
(OR APPROVED EQUAL)

49 | LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 | GALLONS
(OR APPROVED EQUAL)

50 | WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, GALLONS
A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)

SUNDRIES LIST

51 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT — 1-1/2;2;2- | EACH
1/2;3"; 3-1/2":4"

52 | ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS EACH
ABOVE)

53 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES | EACH
SIZES)

54 | ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT EACH

55 | 9 ROLLERS EACH

56 | LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP EACH

57 | INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS EACH

58 | 2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH

59 | 1-1/2° BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH

60 | @ ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH | EACH
SURFACES

61 | 9 ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTAGT CEMENT EACH

62 | 9 ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN EACH

63 | ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT EACH
WHITE ONES)

84 | 4 STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE | EACH

65 | 4 ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINT ROLLERS (NOT EACH

WHITE)

See attached quote
sheet for all products
Home Depot is
providing pricing on -
in the same order as
this page. Attached
list contains links to
the MSDS sheets.
The attached store
quote 1211-424169
has additional
information per
product

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx
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66

6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

EACH

67

4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

EACH

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx
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See attached quote
sheet for all products
Home Depot is
providing pricing on -
in the same order as
this page. Attached
list contains links to
the MSDS sheets.
The attached store
quote 1211-424169
has additional
information per
product




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
BID FOR PAINT-2014-15

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

PACKAGE

BRAND NAME

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

TDS

MSDS

GLIDDEN PREMIUM, SATIN, GLN6200 01

1GAL

4

PPG/GLIDDEN

$19.98

$79.92

http://www.glidden.

http://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GLN62xx

m/MSDS/GLNG 2xx

GLIDDEN DUO, EGGSHELL, GLD 2000 01

1GAL

4

PPG/GLIDDEN

$21.18

$84.72

http://www.glidden.

http://www glidden.co

com/TDS/GLD20XX

m/MSDS/GLD20XX

LIFE MASTER OIL, EGGSHELL, 1502-0110 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$30.89

$123.56

http://www.gliddenp

http://www gliddenpr

rofessional.com/data
sheets/tds/gp-
1502.aspx

ofessional.com/datash
eets/msds/gp-
1502.aspx

GLIDDEN PREMIUM EXTERIOR, SEMI GLOSS,
GL6811 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$21.58

$86.32

http://www.glidden.

http://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GL68xx

m/MSDS/GL68xx

GX ALKYD 150, GLOSS, 1516-0100N-01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$27.58

$110.32

http://www.gliddenp

hitp://www gliddenpr

rofessional.com/data
sheets/tds/gp-
1516.aspx

ofessional.com/datash
eets/msds/gp-
1516.aspx

GLIDDEN PRO CEILING PAINT, GPL-0000-01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$9.58

$38.32

hitp://www.gliddenp|

http://www.gliddenpr

rofessional.com/data
sheets/entds/gpl-

0000.aspx

ofessional.com/datash
eets/enmsds/gpl0000,

GLIDDEN DUO, FLAT, GLD 1000 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$20.38

$81.52

http://www.glidden.

aspx
http://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GLD10XX

m/MSDS/GLD10XX

GLIDDEN DUO, SEMI GLOSS, GLD 3000 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$21.98

$87.92

http://www.glidden.
com/TDS/GLD30XX

http://www.glidden.co
m/MSDS/GLD30XX

GX ALKYD 350, SEMI GLOSS, 1507-0110-01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$31.00

$124.00

http://www.gliddenp

http://www.gliddenpr

rofessional.com/data
sheets/tds/gp-
1507.aspx

ofessional.com/datash
eets/msds/gp-
1507.aspx

10

DIAMOND 350 FLAT, 1201-0110V 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$24.27

$97.08

http://www.glidden

rofessional.com/data
sheets/msds/gp-

1201v.aspx

http://www gliddenpr

ofessional.com/datash
eets/tds/gp-

1201v.aspx

11

DIAMOND 350 SEMI GLOSS 1407-0100V 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$25.78

$103.12

http://www.gliddenp

http://www.gliddenpr

rofessional.com/data
sheets/tds/gp-
1407v.aspx

ofessional.com/datash
eets/specialorders/ms
ds/1407-0100v.aspx

12

GLIDDEN PREMIUM EXTERIOR FLAT, GL61XX

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$21.58

$86.32

http://www.glidden.

http://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GLE1xx

m/MSDS/GL6Lxx

13

GLIDDEN PREMIUM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS,
GL681101

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$27.58

$110.32

http://www.glidden.

http://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GLE8xx

m/MSDS/GLE8Xx

14

PREMIUM EXTERIOR, GLOSS, GL7111 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$23.18

$92.72

http://www.glidden.
com/TDS/GL71xx

http://www.glidden.co
m/MSDS/GL71xx

15

PREMIUM EXTERIOR, GLOSS, GL7111 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$23.18

$92.72

http://www.glidden.

hitp://www.glidden.co

com/TDS/GL71xx

m/MSDS/GL7 1xx

16

PORCH & FLOOR, SATIN, PF7010N 01

1GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$19.55

$78.20

http://www.glidden.
com/TDS/PF70XXN

http://www.glidden.co
m/MSDS/PF70XXN

17

SIKKENS, SOLID STAIN, K710-100.01

1GAL

PPG/SIKKENS

$31.08

$124.32

http://www.glidden

rofessional.com/data
sheets/specialorders
/tds/sik710-100.aspx

bttp://www.gliddenpr

ofessional.com/datash

eets/specialorders/ms
ds/sik710-100.aspx

18

THOMPSON'S WATERSEAL CLEAR
WATERPROOFING WOOD PROTECTOR,
TH.041805-20, SKU# 1000037543

5 GAL

THOMPSON'S

$13.00

$64.98

http://www.homedep

ot.com/catalog/pdfima

ges/c6/c6d628da-73f6-
4822-875a-

031ecB662eh24 ndf

19

FIELD PAINT, 3290-1000 05

5GAL

PPG/GLIDDEN

$7.73

$193.35

http://www.glidden
rofessional.com/data
sheets/tds/3290-

1000.aspx

hitp://www.gliddenpr

ofessional.com/datash
eets/msds/3290-

1000.aspx

20

AUTOMOTIVE PAINT

NO BID

NO BID

RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS

21

RUST-OLEUM PAINTER'S TOUCH 2X, 12 OZ,
GENERAL PURPOSE SPRAY PAINT, SKU# 608169

120z

RUST-OLEUM

$3.87

$3.87

http://www.rustoleu
m.com/~/media/Digi
talEncyclopedia/Doc
uments/Rustoleumt
SA/TDS/English/CBG
[Painters%20Touch%
20Ultra%20Cover%2
02X/PTX-
01 Painters Touch
Ultra Cover 2X Ena

mel_Sprays TDS.ash
X

http://www.rustoleum

.com/MSDS/ENGLISH/
249090.PDF




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
BID FOR PAINT-2014-15

22

RUST-OLEUM RUSTY METAL PRIMER, K7769,
SKU# 221325

1GAL

1 RUST-OLEUM

$31.98

$31.98

http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdfl
mages/25/2592db13
d86e-4a9f-alcf-
e04a95ef48d4.pdf

http://www.homede

ot.com/catalog/pdflma
ges/01/014477b7-a65¢:
421c-9ed9-

d5f392ec7dfd, pdf

23

RUST-OLEUM FLAT WHITE CLEAN METAL
PRIMER, 7780502, SKU# 102365

3207

1 RUST-OLEUM

$8.46

$8.46

http://www.homede
pot.com/catalog/pdfl

http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdfima

mages/25/2592db13
d86e-4af-alcf-

ges/df/df008052-35a0-
49f2-b32d-

e04a95ef48d4.pdf

5a4d587d3ecd.pdf

24

RUST-OLEUM PROFESSIONAL HIGH
PERFORMANCE COLOR ENAMELS, K7764402,
SKU# 469640

1GAL

1 RUST-OLEUM

$31.98

$31.98

http://www.homede

http://www.homedep

ot.com/catalog/pdfl

mages/fa/fa8b71¢5-
8040-4654-94b0-

ot.com/catalog/pdflma

ges/a9/a9ae85cc-bafe-
A808-9b8f-

43b06db94d49.pdf

7e46dee75039 . pdf

WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS

25

FLOOD CLEAR, FLD442.01

1GAL

4 FLOOD

$15.18

$60.72

http://www.glidden

rofessional.com/data

sheets/specialorders
[tds/fld442 aspx

http://www gliddenpr

ofessional.com/datash

eets/specialorders/ms
ds/fld442.a5px

26

THOMPSON'S WATERSEAL CLEAR
WATERPROOFING WOOD PROTECTOR,
TH.041805-20, SKU# 1000037543

5GAL

i THOMPSON'S

$13.00

$64.98

http://www.homede

ot.com/catalog/pdfima
ges/c6/c6d628da-736-
4822-875a-

01ec8662eb24 ndf

27

WOLMAN COPPERCOAT GREEN BELOW
GROUND WOOD PRESERVATIVE, 1902, ONLINE
SKU# 204746309

5 GAL

1 RUST-OLEUM

$17.00

$85.00

http://www.homede

http://www.homedep

ot.com/catalog/pdfl

mages/6c/6c4778d3-
b6fe-4468-944h-

ot.com/catalog/pdfima

ges/22/228bf380-d64b
406d-ala7-

80c038ab71e7.pdf

059caad7441f.pdf

28

THOMPSON'S WATERSEAL SOLID
WATERPROOFING STAIN, TH.043851, SKU#
1000034865

1GAL

1 THOMPSON'S

$28.97

$28.97

http://www homedep

ot.com/catalog/pdfima

ges/49/49e3af79-b69a
4c34-3563~

120507073¢97.odf

29

THOMPSON'S WATERSEAL SEMI-TRANSPARENT
WATERPROOFING STAIN, TH.042851, SKU#
1000037557

1GAL

1 THOMPSON'S

$26.97

$26.97

http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdfima

ges/a2/a2065cad-85a0
4359-a7dd-
52b0b27850dd . ndf

30

MINWAX OIL-BASED WOOD FINISH 250 VOC
INTERIOR STAIN, 71088, SKU#160771

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$29.26

$29.26

hitp://www.homedep
ot.com/catalog/pdfima
ges/88/88e8c933-e356

4456-305f-

afadaa00172b .ndf

31

MINWAX GLOSS HIGH-BUILD POLYURETHANE,
71090, SKU# 233201

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$36.96

$36.96

http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdfima
ges/ae/ae3cle68-46bf-
4el1-3276-
ff8d60f326f8. pdf

32

MINWAX SATIN HIGH-BUILD POLYURETHANE,
71092, SKU# 219190

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$36.96

$36.96

http://www homedep
ot.com/catalog/pdfima
ges/36/360b54ac-4e62
45b6-a74a-~
d¢373df29d89 ndf

33

MINWAX GLOSS HELMSMAN
INDOOR/OUTDOOR SPAR URETHANE, 13215,
SKU# 963596

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$46.00

$46.00

http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdfima

ges/d6/d6d08e32-2¢18;
46ba-8740-

h2eb9990db66,ndf |

PAINT PRODUCTS

34

MINWAX SATIN HELMSMAN
INDOOR/OUTDOOR SPAR URETHANE, 13220,
SKU# 963695

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$46.00

$46.00

http://www.homede|

ot.com/catalog/pdflma
ges/43/43b3e7ee-1eaf
4bd7-99d8-

35

MINWAX GLOSS POLYCRYLIC WATER BASED
PROTECTIVE FINISH, 15555000, SKU# 404675

1GAL

1 MINWAX

$47.96

$47.96

9ebc8ccadhd2 . ndf
http://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdflma

ges/39/39¢f118a-806d
4458-9cab-

7d0009d628f3 pdf




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
BID FOR PAINT-2014-15

MINWAX SATIN POLYCRYLIC WATER BASED

http://www.homede

ot.com/catalog/pdfima

. . ges/41/4132 -
36 | pROTECTIVE FINISH, 13333000, SKU# 404616 | O ! MINWAX 54796 $47.96 es/41/413224de
8497-41ba-aac8-
176837hel196e.pdf
hitp://www.homede
ot.com/catalog/pdflma
RUST-OLEUM PARKS CLEAR GLOSS
~ ; ! .
37 POLYURETHANE, 330513V, SKU# 470947 1 GAL 1 RUST-OLEUM $30.97 $30.97 ges/e2/e2b05dd5-cac7
4352-9e25-
i
http://www.homede|
RUST-OLEUM PARKS CLEAR SATIN cicom/caiales/peiima
- X X b44-
38 POLYURETHANE, 330523V, SKU# 464276 1GAL 1 RUST-OLEUM $30.97 $30.97 ges(dz{sddeii;sn_ 622¢
18e0732359af pdf
http://www.gliddenpr
GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL SPEEDWALL -
39 5 GAL 5 PPG/GLIDDEN $10.06 $251.45 ofessional.com/datash
EGGSHELL, GPS-3000-05 eets/msds/1452v aspx
http://www.gliddenpr
GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL SPEEDWALL
40 1GAL 4 PPG/GLIDDEN $11.18 $44.72 ofessional.com/datash
EGGSHELL, GPS-3000-01 eets/msds/1452v aspx
http://www.gliddenpr
GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL SPEEDWALL :
41 1 GAL 4 PPG/GLIDDEN $11.18 $44.72 ofessional.com/datash
EGGSHELL, GPS-3000-01 cets/msds/1452.aspx
http://www gliddenpr
LIDDEN PROFESSIONAL SPEED | *
42 G GOLOSZ GPS-5000 OSWALL SEM 5 GAL 5 PPG/GLIDDEN $10.06 $251.50 ofessional.com/datash
¢ a a eets/msds/1456v.a5px
http://www.gliddenpr
GLIDDEN PROFE LI
43 GLOSSSSI(GJ:ISA;;;:Z[;WA L SEMI 1GAL 4 PPG/GLIDDEN $11.18 $44.72 ofessional.com/datash
el a eets/msds/1456v.aspx
44 2 PART EPOXY A NO BID NO BID
45 2PART EPOXY B NO BID NO BID
46 AQUAPON 09/3/01 PPG/GLIDDEN NO BID NO BID
47 AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B PPG/GLIDDEN NO BID NO BID
http://www.gliddenp| http://www.gliddenpr
48 DECRA-FLEX 300 SMOOTH, 2260-0100 05 S5 GAL 5 PPG/GLIDDEN $16.76 $419.10 <heets/tds/an- cets/msds/n-
2260.aspx 2260.asp%
LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR,
49 B97C150 NO BID NO BID
http://www.gliddenp| http://www.gliddenpr
g rofessional.com/data| ofessional.com/datash
50 DECRA-FLEX 300 SMOOTH, 2260-0100 05 5 GAL 5 PPG/GLIDDEN $16.76 $419.10 sheets/tds/eb- eets/msds/gp-
2260.aspx 2260.aspx
SUNDRIES LIST
LINZER 1-1/2" STRAIGHT BRUSH LATEX PAINTS,
51a 1827-1.5, SKU# 243298 1 1 LINZER $5.47 $5.47
LINZER 2" STRAIGHT BRUSH LATEX PAINTS, 1827
51b 2, SKU# 243270 1 1 LINZER $6.67 $6.67
LINZER 3" STRAIGHT BRUSH LATEX PAINTS, 1827
51c 3, SKU# 243269 1 1 LINZER $7.87 $7.87
LINZER 4" STRAIGHT BRUSH LATEX PAINTS, 1827
51d 4, KU 243265 1 1 LINZER $8.97 $8.97
LINZER 1-1/2" ANGLED SASH BRUSH LATEX
522 PAINTS, 2827-1.5, SKU# 242770 ! ! LINZER $547 3547
LINZER 2" ANGLED SASH BRUSH LATEX PAINTS,
52b 2827-2, SKU# 242517 1 1 LINZER $6.67 $6.67
LINZER 2" STRAIGHT BRUSH OIL BASED PAINTS,
1 Z . X
532 1852-2, SKU# 451223 ! LINZER $6.67 36.67
LINZER 3" STRAIGHT BRUSH OIL BASED PAINTS,
53b 1852-3, SKU# 451292 1 1 LINZER $7.87 $7.87
LINZER 4" STRAIGHT BRUSH OIL BASED PAINTS,
' . 8.97
>3¢ 1852-4, SKU# 451142 ! ! LINZER 5857 5
LINZER 1-1/2" ANGLED BRUSH OIL BASED
ZE 3 A
54a PAINTS, 2873-1.5, SKU# 464457 ! 1 LINZER $6.97 $6.97
ER 2" ANGLED B )
sab LINZER 2" AN RUSH OIL BASED PAINTS 1 1 LINZER $7.97 $7.97

2873-2, SKU# 464665




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
BID FOR PAINT-2014-15

S54c

LINZER 3" ANGLED BRUSH OIL BASED PAINTS,
2873-3, SKU# 464899

1 LINZER

$9.97

$9.97

55

9" HEAVY-DUTY ROLLER FRAME, RF211-9, SKU#
418312

1 LINZER

$3.57

$3.57

56

LINZER METAL DEEP-WELL ROLLER TRAY,
RMA435, SKU# 852414

1 LINZER

$7.97

$7.97

57

LINZER PLASTIC DEEP-WELL TRAY LINER, RM412,
SKU# 706920

1 LINZER

$1.80

$1.80

58

HDX 1.88" X 60 YDS. MULTI-SURFACE PAINTER'S
TAPE (6-PACK) HD-BDT-2 6 PK, SKU# 509616

6 HDX

$5.32

$31.93

59

HDX 1.44" X 60 YDS. MULTI-SURFACE PAINTER'S
TAPE, HD-BDT-1.5, SKU# 509286

1 HDX

$5.33

$5.33

60a

LINZER 9" X 3/8" NAP MEDIUM-DENSITY
POLYESTER ROLLER COVER, ALL PAINTS &
STAINS, RC 1538, SKU# 639247

1 LINZER

$3.27

$3.27

60b

LINZER 9" X 1/2" NAP MEDIUM-DENSITY
POLYESTER ROLLER COVER, ALL PAINTS &
STAINS, RC 1550, SKU# 639268

1 LINZER

$3.47

$3.47

60c

LINZER 9" X 3/4" NAP MEDIUM-DENSITY
POLYESTER ROLLER COVER, ALL PAINTS &
STAINS, RC 1575, SKU# 639286

1 LINZER

$3.97

$3.97

61

LINZER 9" X 1/4" NAP ADHESIVE AND EPOXY
ROLLER COVER, RC118-9, SKU# 112364

1 LINZER

$3.97

$3.97

62

LINZER 9" X 3/8" NAP MEDIUM-DENSITY
POLYESTER ROLLER COVER, ALL PAINTS &
STAINS, RC 1538, SKU# 639247

1 LINZER

$3.27

$3.27

63

LINZER 6" PAINT MINI ROLLER FRAME, HD RF
602-11, SKU# 458015

1 LINZER

$2.97

$2.97

64

LINZER 5" FLAT STAIN BLOCK BRUSH, 3350-5,
THREADED HANDLE, SKU# 112385

1 LINZER

$9.97

$9.97

65

LINZER 4" PAINT MINI ROLLER FRAME, HD RF
100-11, SKU# 454465

1 LINZER

$2.48

$2.48

66

LINZER 6" X 3/8" NAP MEDIUM DENSITY KNIT
ROLLER COVERS, {2-PACK}, HD MR 1538-2 6,
SKU# 363630

2 LINZER

$2.49

$4.97

67

LINZER 4" X 3/8" NAP MEDIUM DENSITY KNIT
ROLLER COVERS, (2-PACK), HD MR 1538-2 4,
SKU# 275526

2 LINZER

$2.34

$4.67




G AT AR T = e
STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)

GALLONS

T | SUPER PA
7 | ONE GOAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. GALLONS
COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL
|
3| OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST, COLORS- | GALLONS
BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL
4 | EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- | GALLONS
BM0S6 OR APPROVED EQUAL
§ | ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. GALLONS
COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL
& | ROVAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
7 | ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX — AGST. GALLONS
COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL
8 | ROVAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS - ASST, COLORS-BM | GALLONS
333 OR APPROVED EQUAL
§ | ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS — ASST. COLORS- BM- | GALLONS
207 OR APPROVED EQUAL
70| INTERIOR VINYL LATEX - FLAT- 8M 275 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
1| INTERIOR VINLY LATEX - GLOSS- BM 276 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
12 | EXTERIOR VINVL LATEX - FLAT- BM-171 OR GALLONS
QPPROVED EQUAL
13| EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX - SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR | GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
14 | EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX - GLOSS- BM M 28 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
15| MASONRY ENAMEL - GLOSS- BM M22 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
16 | PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
17| EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED | GALLONS ]
EQUAL |
18| WOOD PRESERVATIVEAVATERPROGFING, GALLONS |
THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED -qf 5
EQUAL ‘
19| FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. GALLONS n L ‘VP |
NTAI R APPRQVED EQUA! w Sﬁﬁl / LWH' K}‘J M U (ﬂ tj'o/ c Lﬂ( U 45{'_
FEI050T @me%«ﬂ%&w Mg i AT
20| AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR GALLONS 1
APPROVED EQUAL E F’“’tﬁ
RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS GALLONS ol B oot
31| SPRAY - ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ/CAN 115)5 | GALLONS
STAR
72| RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X GALLONS 3 7
Z:'BIDS.2014414.BID.PAINT.docx [}



NEW METAL PRIMER

GALLONS

24 RUSTOLEUM — ASST. COLORS GALLONS }
WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS GALLONS
25 C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS \
26 THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL - CLEAR OR APPROVED | GALLONS
EQUAL
27 WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), GALLONS
WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL
28 THOMPSON WATER SEAL — SOLID COLORS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
28 THOMPSON WATER SEAL ~ SEMI-GLOSS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
30 MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, GALLONS
(ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL
3 MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
32 MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
33 MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
PAINT PRODUCTS GALLONS
34 MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
35 VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
36 VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
37 VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS
EQUAL
38 VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL | GALLONS /
39 PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR 5 GALLON
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS
40 PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE 1 GALLON
EGGSHELL CANS
41 PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR 1 GALLON
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS
&7 P
42 PITTSBURGH SEM! GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5 GALLON “/ W
CANS
Z\B1DS.2014%14.BID.PAINT.docx 10
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43

TTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)

1 GALLON

CANS

44 | 2 PART EPOXY A GALLONS

45 | Z PART EXPOXY B GALLONS

46| AQUAPON 08/3/01 { OR APPROVED EQUAL) GALLONS

47 | AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED | GALLONS
EQUAL)

48 | LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES | GALLONS
(OR APPROVED EQUAL)

20 | LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97GC150 | GALLONS
(OR APPROVED EQUAL)

50 | WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, GALLONS
A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)

SUNDRIES LIST

51 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT - 1-1/2,2:2- | EACH
1/2,3% 3-12"4"

52 | ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS EACH
ABOVE)

53 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES | EACH
SIZES)

54 | ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT EACH

55 | 9" ROLLERS EACH

56 | LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP EACH

57 | INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS EACH

58 | 2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH

55 | 1-1/2° BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH

80 | 9’ ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH | EACH
SURFACES

81 | 9" ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTAGT CEMENT EACH

82 | 9 ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN EACH

63 | ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT EAGH
WHITE ONES)

64 | 4 STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE | EACH

65 | 4" ROLLER RANDLES FOR MiNI ROLLERS (NOT EACH

WHITE)

Z:1\BIDS.201414.BID.PAINT.docx
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6" MiNI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

56 EACH
67 | 4" MiNi COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE) EACH
Z:\BIDS.2014\14 BID.PAINT.docx 12
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ol

73-410-01

[LO

B B 21V
SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQ PITTSBURGH

1GALSATIN | TIMELESS ExT. | $45.07
2 | ONE COAT SELF PRIVING HOUSE PAINT - ASST, GALLONS
COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL 7611001 1 PITTSBURGH | o0 o4

1GAL SATIN | SUNPROOF EXT.
3| OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS- | GALLONS | ¢ 147001 . s38.62
BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL 1 GALSATIN | SPEEDHIDEEXT, |* "

4 EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- GALLONS 78-811-01 PITTSBURGH

BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL 1GALSEM! | SUNPROOF EXT $28.91
5 | ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. GAILONS | 5161001 .

COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL | AL GLOSS | SPEEDIME ExT. 93862
& | ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE.BM 258 OR GALLONS | 174501 | PTTSBURGH | 9130

APPROVED EQUAL 1GALFLAT | PREMIUM INT. ‘
7 | ROVAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX = ASST, GALLONS | 211001 | prrrsauncn

COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL LGALFLAT lvaamano [ $32.08
§ | ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS —ASST. COLORS-BM | GALLONS .

333 OR APPROVED EQUAL 8251001 | PITTSBURGH g4 4

1 GAL SATIN |MANORHALL INT.

9 | ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS —ASST. COLORS-BM- | GALLONS
207 OR APPROVED EQUAL 7-844-01 PPG $35.67
1GALSEMI |  INDUSTRIAL

70 | INTERIOR VINVL LATEX — FLAT- BM 275 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL 6-70-01 PPG $18.14
1GALFLAT | SPEEDHIDE INT.
11| INTERIOR VINLY LATEX — GLOSS- BV 276 OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL 6-500-01 PPG $23.52
1GALSEMI | SPEEDHIDE INT,
12| EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX - FLAT- BM-171 OR GALLONS -
SrPROED P 6-650-01 PPG $28.81
1GALFLAT | SPEEDHIDE BT
13| EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX - SEMI-GLOSS- BM-170 OR | GALLONS | ¢ o701 ore
APPROVED L :
ROVED EQUA T GALSEMI | SPEEDHIDE BT $28.91
12 i’éﬁﬁ%\?&"&'&i LATEX - GLOSS- BVI M 28 OR GALLONS | op.374.01 P $35.01
1GALGLOSS | PITTECH DTM
15| MASONRY ENAMEL — GLOSS- BM M22 OR GALLONS Py
APPROVED EQUAL 7-282-01 PPG $35.01
1GALGLOSS |  INDUSTRIAL
6| PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED GALLONS o
PORCH 361001 | PITTSBURGH |g44 3
1GAL GLOSS | PORCH & FLOOR
77| EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYWPIC OR APPROVED | GALLONS | oo LTI 651
EQUAL $26.
1GALSTAIN |  SEMITRANS
18 | WOOD PRESERVATIVEMWATERPROOFING, GALLONS
THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED 794012 THOMPSON | o6 77
EQUAL 1GAL WOOD
PRESERVATIVE| PROTECTOR
8| FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL, GALLONS o
CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL 50-310-01 PPG $57.08

5GALFLAT | ZONEMARK EXT.

20 AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL
RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS GALLONS

21 gTPEQY —ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ/CAN115)5 | GALLONS | e h RUSTOLEUM
12 0Z.CAN 2X SPRAY $3.44

22 | RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X GALLONS 7760901 RUSTOLEUM | $38.90

1GALFLAT | RUSTY PRIME

Z:\BIDS.2014\14 BID PAINT .docx 9
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23 | NEW METAL PRIVER GALLONS —— RUSTOLEUM | $38.00
1GALFLAT | CLEAN PRIME '
24 | RUSTOLEUM — ASST. COLORS GALLONS | o onsed | musToLEum 3590
1 GAL GLOSS | ENAMEL COLORS [®°°"
WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS GALLONS
75 | C-W.F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS - cwrwoon g
22.72
1GALCLEAR | PRESERVATIVE
26 | THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL — CLEAR OR APPROVED | GALLONS
o 7912 THOMPSON  |g50 o6
1GALCLEAR | WATER SEAL
37 | WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), GALLONS
1707 CWF WOOD
OODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL
WOODLIF 1GAL PRESERVATIVE | $24.81
STAIN STAIN
28 | THOMPSON WATER SEAL — SOLID COLORS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL 16411 THOMPSON $18.27
1 GAL SOLID STAIN
29 | THOMPSON WATER SEAL — SEMI-GLOSS OR GALLONS
APPROVED EQUAL 16331 THOMPSON 815,06
1 GAL SEMI STAIN
30 | MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, | GALLONS
! 200 SERIES MINWAX
UAL
(ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQ oo NAX | 532,05
COLORS STAINS
37| MINWAXTNTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS P VINAX | 5sa.58
1GAL GLOSS | POLYURETHANE
32 | MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS 31166 MINWAX | $54.58
APPROVED EQUAL 1 GAL SATIN | POLYURETHANE
33 | MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
APPROVED B 13225 | MINWAXSPAR | $49.44
1GALGLOSS |  URETHANE
PAINT PRODUCTS GALLONS
34 | MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR GALLONS
e EXTERIOF 13220 | MINWAXSPAR | g4 44
1GALSATIN | URETHANE
35| VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED | GALLONS 200037 VARATHANE |547.84
EQUAL 1GALGLOSS |  FLECTO
36 | VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED | GALLONS | 300731 VARATHANE
EQUAL 1GALSATIN | FLecTo | $44.86
37 | VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED GALLONS 503 VARNTHANE _|337.18
EQUAL 1GAL GLOSS FLECTO
38 | VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL | GALLONS 9131 VARATHANE 335,89
1 GAL SATIN FLECTO
30| PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR 5GALLON | 641105 PPG $107.56
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS 5 GAL EGGSHL| SPEEDHIDE INT.
20| PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE | 7 GALLON .
EGGSHELL CANS 6-411-01 PPG $21.51
1 GAL EGGSHL| SPEEDHIDE INT.
71 [ PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR TGALLON — 2151
APPROVED EQUAL) CANS i GZEEG?;;HL SPEEI;:IGDE INT sz
47 | PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL) | 5GALLON | 5.500.05 s $113.71
CANS SGALSEMI | SPEEDHIDE INT,

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx
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PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPRO 650001 | ppG
CANS 1GALSEMI | SPEEDHIDE INT.
44 | 2PART EPOXY A GALLONS  195.1000 1 GAL|PPG AQUAPON 35| $55.70
25 | 2 PART EXPOXY B GALLONS |95 1010 1 GALIPPG AQUAPON 35| $36.90
45| AQUAPON 0973/01 { OR APPRGVED EGUAL) GALLONS | og1.00 AQUAPON | 563,90
1GALPRTA | WATERBASE
r 2‘832{’,0” 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED | GALLONS | oo nQuArON Is48.42
1GALPRTB | WATERBASE
e (Lgé(?\r; g(gov\\;é\gEE%Pﬁﬁ?HNG SYSTEM A 24 SERIES | GALLONS 22201 ore 530,53
1GALTOPCT | PERMACRETE
39| LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 | GALLONS
(OR APPROVED EQUAL)
50 | WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, GALLONS
A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) : G‘LfZTOO;G PER‘\:XSRETE $30.93
SUNDRIES LIST
51 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT - 1-1/2;2";2- | EACH 3108 SERIES | WOOSTER 1.91,2.39,3.73
112,37 311274 LATEX STRT | SOFTIPBRUSH |°+-20 ™ 1840
52 ﬁgg\l;%) BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS EACH 08 SEREs | woosten | [RS 3T ATE
LATEX ANGL | SOFTIP BRUSH
53 | STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES | EACH 1123SERIES | WoOSTER  |52.04, 245,367,
SIZES) OILSTRT | AMBERBRUSH [94.56, - .6.42
54 | ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT EACH 1233SERIES | WOOSTER  B2.32, 3.08 —
OILANGL | AMBERBRUSH |, oo
55 | 9 ROLLERS EACH 239 woosTER |
3/8"NAP 9"ROLLER :
56 | LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP EACH ra0a WOOSTER 270
LARGE PAN DELUXE
57 | INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS EACH 105 WOOSTER | o
LARGELINER |  DELUXE :
58 | 2 BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH 06820 W 2090 | 5708
2'TAPE BLUETAPE
59| 1-1/2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE EACH 06819 M 2090 | ga00
1.5 TAPE BLUE TAPE
50| ' ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SWOOTH | EACH oo woosTeR | $2.26
1/2"NAP 9”ROLLER
67 | & ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT EACH RC1160 P— 5202
/4" NAP ROLLER :
52 | 9 ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN EACH P WOOSTER  |$2.73
3/16"NAP 9"ROLLER
3 | ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6° MINI ROLLERS (NOT EACH 93859 p— 5535
WHITE ONES) 6"HANDLE | SHORT JOHN
64 | 4 STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE | EACH 1430400 beTT 5024
4"BRUSH | STAIN BRUSH
5 | 4 ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT EACH 03720 SHURLNE | g3.26
WHITE) 4"HANDLE | 4"HANDLE

Z:ABIDS.2014\14 BID PAINT. docx 11
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66 6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE) EACH 9425 BESTT $5.42
6"ROLLER | JOHN LNG / SHRT

67 4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE) EACH SL03730 SHURLINE $2.58
4"ROLLER MICROFIBER

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.PAINT.docx



EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS

LINE 1 — PITTSBURGH TIMELESS SATIN EXTERIOR (73-410) INSTEAD OF A89W1151
LINE 2 — PITTSBURGH SUN PROOF SATIN EXTERIOR (76-110) INSTEAD OF BM 103
LINE 3 — PPG SPEEDHIDE WB ALKYD SATIN (6-1410) INSTEAD OF BM110

LINE 4 — PITTSBURGH SUN PROOF SEMI GLOSSS EXTERIOR (78-811) INSTEAD OF BM096
LINE 5 —PPG SPEEDHIDE WB ALKYD GLOSS (6-1610) INSTEAD OF BM110

LINE 6 — PITTSBURGH PREMIUM CEILING (17-45) INSTEAD OF BM 258

LINE 7 — PITTSBURGH MANOR HALL FLAT ENAMEL (82-110) INSTEAD OF BM215
LINE 8 - PITTSBURGH MANOR HALL SEM| GLOSS (82-510) INSTEAD OF BM333
LINE 9 — PPG INDUSTRIAL SEMI GLOSS (7-844) INSTEAD OF BM207

LINE 10— PPG SPEEDHIDE INTERIOR FLAT (6-70) INSTEAD OF BM275

LINE 11 — PPG SPEEDHIDE INTERIOR SEMI GLOSS (6-500) INSTEADOF BM276

LINE 12 — PPG SPEEDHIDE EXTERIOR FLAT (6-650) INSTEAD OF BM171

LINE 13 — PPG SPEEDHIDE EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS (6-901) INSTEAD OF BM170
LINE 14 - PPG PITT TECH DTM GLOSS (90-374) INSTEAD OF BM M28

LINE 15 — PPG INDUSTRIAL GLOSS (7-282) INSTEAD OF BM M22

LINE 16 — PITTSBURGH PORCH & FLOOR GLOSS (3-610) INSTEAD OF BM112

LINE 48 — PPG PERMA CRETE ACRYLIC TOP COAT (4-22) INSTEAD OF LOXON XP

LINE 50 — PPG PERMA CRETE ACRYLIC TOP COAT (4-22) INSTEAD OF LOXON A24W451



