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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
 

Resolution   # 846 
 

AWARDS BID FOR PAINT 
 

Councilman Dunleavy  offered the following resolution, 

which was seconded by  Councilman Wooten 
 

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice for 
sealed bids for PAINT for the Town of Riverhead and; 
 

WHEREAS, 3 bids were received and opened at 2:05 am on NOVEMBER 25, 
2014 at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, the date, time and place 
given in the Notice to Bidders. 
 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the bid for PAINT for the Town of 
Riverhead be and hereby is, awarded to the following vendors: RIVERHEAD BUILDING 
SUPPLY (ITEMS 11, 17, 21, 28, 29, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40,  42, 44-47, 51-62, 64); HOME 
DEPOT (ITEMS 1-10, 12-16, 22-27, 30-33, 34, 38, 41, 43, 48, 63, 65, 66, 67); JOHN 
DEERE (ITEM 19). Sheets attached. 
 

RESOLVED, that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of 
this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a certified copy of 
same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk. 

 
THE VOTE 

Giglio   Yes No       Gabrielsen Yes No 
Wooten Yes No            Dunleavy Yes No 

Walter Yes No 
 

The Resolution Was  Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted 
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                       HOME DEPOT             RBS                JOHN DEERE
ITEM   # DESCRIPTION UNIT PACKAGE BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE

1 SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 
(OR EQUAL) GALLONS 4 GALLON PPG/GLIDEN $19.98 PITTSBURGH $45.07 NO BID

2
ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE 
PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $21.18 PITTSBURGH $28.91
NO BID

 3
OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - 
ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $30.89 PPG $38.62
NO BID

4
EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - 
ASST. COLORS-BM096 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $21.58 PITTSBURGH $28.91
NO BID

5
ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - 
ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $27.58 PPG $38.62
NO BID

6 ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 
258 OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $9.58 PITTSBURGH $18.80 NO BID

7
ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX – 
ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $20.38 PITTSBURGH $32.08
NO BID

8
ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. 
COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $21.98 PITTSBURGH $35.01
NO BID

9
ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. 
COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $31.00 PPG INDUSTRIAL $35.67
NO BID

10 INTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM 275 
OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $24.27 PPG $18.14 NO BID

11 INTERIOR VINLY LATEX – GLOSS- BM 
276 OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $31.08 PPG SPEEDHIDE $23.52 NO BID

12 EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-
171 OR QPPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $21.58 PPG $28.81 NO BID

13 EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- 
BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $27.58 PPG $28.91

NO BID
14 EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM 

M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $23.18 PPG $35.01 NO BID
15 MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 

OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $23.18 PPG $35.01 NO BID
16 PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $19.55 PITTSBURGH $44.39 NO BID
17 EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR 

APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $31.08 OLYMPIC $26.51 NO BID

18

WOOD 
PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, 
THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

GALLONS 4 GALLON/CS PPG/GLIDEN $13.00 THOMPSON $26.77

NO BID

19 FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. 
CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS  $7.93 PPG $57.08

KRYLON BULK WHITE
$6.50 GALLON               
(5 GAL.BUCKET)

20 AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) 
OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS GALLONS NO BID
21 SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ 

CAN 11.5) 5 STAR GALLONS 12 OZ. RUSTOLEUM $3.87 RUSTOLEUM $3.44 NO BID
22 RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X  1 GALLON RUSTOLEUM $31.98 GALLON $38.90 NO BID
23 NEW METAL PRIMER GALLONS 32 OZ. RUSTOLEUM $8.46 RUSTOLEUM $38.90 NO BID
24 RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS GALLONS 1 GALLON RUSTOLEUM $31.98 RUSTOLEUM $38.90 NO BID

WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS   
25 C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON FLOOD $15.18 CWF $22.72 NO BID
26 THOMPSON’S WATER SEAL – CLEAR 

OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON THOMPSONS $13.00 THOMPSON $20.26 NO BID

27
WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN 
(EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE 
PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON RUSTOLEUM $17.00 CWF $24.81

NO BID



                       HOME DEPOT             RBS                JOHN DEERE
ITEM   # DESCRIPTION UNIT PACKAGE BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE

28 THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID 
COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON THOMPSONS $28.97 THOMPSON $18.27 NO BID

29 THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-
GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON  THOMPSON $16.06 NO BID

30
MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN 
INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 
SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $29.26 MINWAX $32.95

NO BID

31
MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS 
POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $36.96 MINWAX $54.58
NO BID

32
MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN 
POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $36.96 MINWAX $54.58
NO BID

33
MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS 
POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $46.00 MINWAX $49.44
NO BID

PAINT PRODUCTS GALLONS 1 GALLON NO BID

34
MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN 
POLYURETHANE  OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $36.96 MNWAX $49.44
NO BID

35 VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR 
APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $36.96 VARATHANE $47.84 NO BID

36 VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR 
APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS    VARATHANE $44.86 NO BID

37 VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR 
APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON MINWAX $46.00 VARATHANE $37.19 NO BID

38 VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR 
APPROVED EQUAL GALLONS 1 GALLON $30.97 VARATHANE $35.89 NO BID

39 PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL  
(OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5 GALLON CANS 5 GALLON $30.97 PPG SPEEDHIDE $107.56 NO BID

40 PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 
SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL 1 GALLON CANS 1 GALLON $21.51 PPG $21.51 NO BID

41 PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL  
(OR APPROVED EQUAL) 1 GALLON CANS 1 GALLON $11.18 PPG $21.51 NO BID

42 PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR 
APPROVED EQUAL) 5 GALLON CANS 5 GALLON $11.18 PPG SPEEDHIDE $113.71 NO BID

43 PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR 
APPROVED EQUAL) 1 GALLON CANS 1 GALLON $10.06 PPG $23.52 NO BID

44 2 PART EPOXY A GALLONS NO BID $11.18 PPG AQUAPON $55.70 NO BID
45 2 PART EXPOXY B GALLONS NO BID NO BID PPG AQUAPON $38.90 NO BID
46 AQUAPON 09/3/01 ( OR APPROVED 

EQUAL) GALLONS 1 GALLON NO BID AQUAPON WATERBASE $63.90 NO BID
47 AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR 

APPROVED EQUAL) GALLONS 1 GALLON NO BID AQUAPON WATERBASE $48.42 NO BID

48 LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM 
A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL) GALLONS 1 GALLON $16.76 PPG $30.93

NO BID

49
LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, 
CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED 
EQUAL)

GALLONS 1 GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

50
WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA 
WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED 
EQUAL)

GALLONS 1 GALLON $16.76 PPG PERMACRETE $30.93
NO BID

SUNDRIES LIST   NO BID
51 STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX 

PAINT – 1-1/2;2”;2-1/2;3”; 3-1/2”;4”  EACH EACH LINDZER $5.47 WOOSTER 1.91,2.39,3.73.4.30,6.40 NO BID
52 ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME 

SIZES AS ABOVE)  EACH EACH LINDZER $5.47 WOOSTER 2.63,3.15,4.79 NO BID
53 STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED 

PAINT (SAMES SIZES)  EACH EACH LINDZER $7.87 WOOSTER 2.04,2.45,3.67,4.56,6.42 NO BID
54 ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED 

PAINT  EACH EACH LINDZER $6.67 WOOSTER 2.32,3.04,4.56 NO BID
55 9” ROLLERS  EACH NO BID LINDZER $5.47 WOOSTER $2.83 NO BID
56 LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP  EACH EACH LINDZER $6.67 WOOSTER $2.79 NO BID



                       HOME DEPOT             RBS                JOHN DEERE
ITEM   # DESCRIPTION UNIT PACKAGE BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE

57 INSERTS FOR DEEP  ROLLER PANS  EACH EACH LINDZER $6.67 WOOSTER $0.70 NO BID
58 2” BLUE PAINTERS TAPE  EACH NO BID LINDZER $7.87 3M $7.98 NO BID
59 1-1/2” BLUE PAINTERS TAPE  EACH NO BID  $8.97 3M $5.99 NO BID
60 9” ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. 

& SMOOTH SURFACES  EACH EACH LINDZER $6.97 WOOSTER $2.26 NO BID
61 9” ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT 

CEMENT  EACH EACH LINDZER $3.97 BESTT $2.82 NO BID
62 9” ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN  EACH $3.97 WOOSTER $2.73 NO BID
63 ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6” MINI 

ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)  EACH $2.97 BESTT $5.35 NO BID
64 4” STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM 

STICK HANDLE  EACH $8.97 BESTT $9.24 NO BID
65 4” ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI 

ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)  EACH $2.97 SHURLINE $3.26 NO BID
66 6” MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS 

(NOT WHITE)  EACH $2.97 BESTT $5.42 NO BID
67 4” MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS 

(NOT WHITE)  EACH $3.47 SHURLINE $2.58 NO BID
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