
12/5/95 
Adopte:d 

TOWN OF f31VERttEI\D 

Resofution # 7 7 9 --,.------,..-_,--.,-,..._,...,.-

AUTHORIZES TOWN I CbEAK TO PUBLfSH 
AND POSJ: PUBLIC NOTICE TO CHANGE 

TIME OF RE.GUlAR TOW·N BOARD MEETING 

1499 

COUNCILMAN PRUSI.NOWSKI 
offered the foUowing resolution, 

wbich was seconded by ----~=.:;;...~~----~~~~ 

. RESOLVED, that the To·wn Cl'erk be and is hereby directed to publish the 
attached PubU.c lttJotice once in the December 13, 1995, issue of the Suffolk County Life , . 

. the.,officiat ~ewspaper of the To,wn of Riverhead designated for that purpose. 
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, TOWN 0F Rt'VERHEAD 
RIJBLIC N·OTI-CE .-

-,. 

. 1500 

. \ 

PLEASE TAKE NOTI.CE, that the time ot the next regul.arly sanedufed meeting of 
the Town Board of the Town of Riverhead will be held on December 19, 1995, shaU b~ 
2:00 o'cJock .,p .. m. at Town Haf-t, 200 H-owell Avenue, Riverhead, New York. 

Dated: Riverhead, New York 
December 5, 1995. 

., -

\1 I '•( ' 

-, ' 

BY ·oRDER OF THE TOWN BOARD 
OF THE TOWN OF ·RJVIiRHEAO 

BAflBARA GRATTAN, Town C>lerk 

' 1 

z: d. 



I . . TOWN OF . RIVERHEA·. :DA~opte·a ... ,,_ 
t M7lf/fl20l . R 1 t . # . u 
J eso u 1on 780 

I OllDER CALLiNG PUBLIC HEAR!NG FOR INCREASE AND IMPROVE~1ENTS .,?cfll.3-
RIVE~EAD WAtER DISTRICT (WELL.S REHABlLITATIOM)' ,, · . ., 

I 
At a regtirar meeting of the 

. · -· · ·Town ·soard of the .. Town · o'f 
- ~- ·· · Riverhea,d, Suffolk Count:;y, Ne~ 

·1• York, held at the Tow.n Hall, in 
·Ri verbead, N·ew · York i ·n aai~ 
Town, on the 5th day of 
Deeember 1.995, at 1 ~ ~ "4 · 

o'clock f_ .. M.; Prevail-ing l'ime . . 

15.01 

offered t~e fo·llowing J;esolution, which was seoonde< 

by COUNOiu,wl PBUSINQWSJO 

JAMES. R • . STARK 

' 
' ' • ,f 

' . . 
~ 

In the Matter 
ot 

the Inerea.se and I~rovem.ent 
of facilitie• of tbe Riverhead 
Water D1str·ict· ot . the· Town of 

· Uverhead. Suffa~~ Ca~ty, 
·lew Xork 

• • 
• • 
• • 
• . . 
• • .. . " 
• • 
• . (i 

• 

}, ' 

1 I 

)'• 

~, ·the To~ Board of the Tgwn of Riverhead • . Suffolk 

<'.owtty, New York, has dul:y ,eausea to be P·repared a map, plan ana 
' ' . ~ 

' ' 

.. 



t ~-

t ~ l 50 2 
I 
It f report . ~n.cluding an eetimate ot co.st relating to ·the increase and 

im~rovement of the facilities of t~e Riverhead Water Dist~ict .of 

1aid Town, consisting of the redrilling, deepening and improvement 

.. , 

Riverhead Water District in the matter described above, and to hear 

ali persont lnt.ereeted 1n the subject thereof, oonderning the same, 

in acc~:rda;n.ce with the provisions of Section 202-b sf the Town L~; 

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS ltEREBY 

ORDERED, by the Town Boar~ of the Town of Riverhead, Suffolk 

County, New York, as follows: 
( 

$tction 1. A public hearing will be hela at the Town Hall, 

Hot~ell Avenue, in ltiverhead, New 'York, iri said Town, on the 

j. l .9t:h day ot De~emher, 1995, a~ ·2:2~ o'<:loc~ ~.M., P·~evailing Titne~ 

question of the increase and improv~ment of. thE:$ faeilities 

Riverhead Water District of the Town of Riverhead, Suffolk 

County, New York in the manner described in the preambles hereof, 

'and: to hear ail ., persons·' inte.rested in the subje·et tbe);eof, 

COQ.¢f'#~ning the ' ·•atne. and tc) taJt·e •u~h aation th.~reon as is nqutred 

uthori;,.d by law~ 

The Town Clerk i•_. hereby i'Utborized 4}10 <Ureot.ea 

cau•e a copy of the Notice of Public Hearing bereinafter 

PrOvt&td to be- publi•hed on<:e 1~ S\, U•; )') L<~ ;:;.:.A l t '.t«:., the, 

> J 



1503 
i· . 
t 

I -3..., . 
t . 
f official newspaper of the ~o\tln designated for this purpose , and 

I

I allo tO cause a COPY thereof tO be posted On the Sign board Of the 

:ToWn, such publication and posting to be made not less than ten, 

i ft\Ore than twenty" dal(S before the date d~signa.ted f ·or the 

.h~ring. 

seqtian J .. 

' •' 

' I 

The notice of public hearing shall be in 

following form: 

'· 

', '. 

r . 

.. . t' 



~· : 

I 
1 

l 
1504 

NQl'ICE OF PQB~IC HEARING 
! 

NOTICE IS HERBBY GIVEN that the Town Board of the Town of 

Riverhead, SUffolk County, New York, will meet at the Town Hall , .. 

J 200 Jtowell Avenue, in Riverhead, Ne1t1 York, i n said Town, on the 

. f ... 1'~th day .o·f De-eembex, ~99:5, at 2:20 o' elo~~, P·.M ... ·; ·· Prevailing · T~ma# 

~ for the purpose of conducting a public bearing upon a certain ~~~~. 
J 

· i plan and report ineluding an estimate of cost prepared in relation 
r 
} t o the proposed increase and improvement of the facilities of the 

!: Ri verhead Water District of the Town of River head, suffolk County, 
' 
J New York, consisting of the redrilling, deepening and improvement 
t , l of various wells !noluding original £urnishinga, equipment, 

, ] , ntac;binery" appar,a;t!qa , · appurtenance.s, .anq i®14ental im~ro,emenbs ,,< •.. · · .•. 

. f and expenses in conneotion therewith, · ~t . a miVcilllum estimat ed oo•t 

f. of $957,000. · 

J Pursuant to the State Environmental Quality Review Act and the 

r&gulations promulgated thereunder, it has been determined that 
' 

said project will not have any aign.ifi~ant environmental effects 

th~ environment . 

· .) . At sai4 publ.;i t: hea.ri hg said Town. Dca~4,,- wi ll hear. all 

~'·int~rested in t tl• . S~jeat matter t hereof. . . . 

Dated; Riverhead, ~ew Yo~k 
December _ s- , 1995 

'•' 

SY ORDER OF THE TO'WN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF 
R.IVEllHEAD, SOFPOLX COUNTY, NEW YOIUt 
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~ctiop 4. This Order shall take effect immediately. 



The question of the adoption of the foregoing Order was duly 

to a vote on roll call, which resulted as follows: 

.pep'-7tY S,upe»vi~Qr S~ark VOTING ·, Yes --
.¥es 

Councilman Crei9h t;on 
_.( n < t ' VOTING 

Councilwoman Gilliam VOTING Yes 

VOTING 

The O'rder was th•reuJ>on declared duly. adopted .. 

• • 
' . 

( ' 

'' 

'\ 

,' 
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,. 

) 
) ss~ 

OF SUFFOLK ) 

.. 
I,' the undersigned Clerk of the Town of R-iverhead, Suffolk 

New · York, DO !,~RESY CERTI·FY:' '' 

Tbat :t." have o.ompared the. annexed extract of tae ·minutes of .,the 

meeting of the Town Board of s~id Town, inclu4ing . the order 
I • I ' 

contained therein# held on Decemb~r s, 1995 1 with the original 

' thereof on file in my office, and that the same is a true and 

correct · tr·anscript therefrom and of the whole of said original so 

fa1: aa the aa-me. r~lates to the sUbject matters tthere±n referred to .. 

l ·. ~THEJ\ CERTIFY that tl.l . members of !laid Boa,rd .. bad due 

of said meeting~ ,, 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that, pursuant to Section 103 of the Public 
,, ' 

. ' ' . ' 

Off1.cers Law {Open Meetings Law) , said meeting was open to the 

· gen.e·ral pu))lic. . ~ 

r · rURT.'HER· CER,~IFY' that,. fBlQ& to the time of said · meeting, ·y 

' l 

duly oauseo a public no~ic:e of . the . time an4· pl .• ce Qf s~id. meeting , · 

to be give~ to the following newspapers and/or other news media ~s 

follows: ·· 

S~fol$ COunty Li fe " 

' ,, 

'' ' ' 

' . ' 

Date given 

December 1 1 l995 

' ' 
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I Ft1R'rRER C~RTIFY tnat EBlQB to the time of said meeting , I 

duly caused public notice ~f the t~me and p~ac1:1 ·of said meeting to 

be conspiouous.ly pos.teQ in . the 

,. ! · loeatlon(s) · on the following dates: 

I. tleaiSnatad Location' (e) 
. , gf potted. notlg~:~ 

f l :. To:n Clerk's Bulletin board 

following desi gnated public 

Date of Postt;ng 

December 6 , 1995 

IN WITNESS ~RE.OF, I have hereunto Stlt my ·bAAd .and a.ff i x·ed 

t he .s - a.l ... of said Town on December 6th , 1.995. · · 

~ (CORPORATE 
. ~SAL) 

I • 

' . 

{. . ~ 



STATE OF NEW ~ORK 

· · coom'Y OF SUFFOLK 

afFIOAYIT OF POSTIN9 

) 
} S$. : 
.r 

1509 

I, the \lndersigned Cl,erk of the Town of Ri verhea.d# Suffolk 
' ' ' ' I 

: County, New· York, DBPOSE AND SAY: 
I t ; 

· ·' That on the · .6th day of December I 1995, I Qaused to 
---~~~( ----

.}>e aosted on the :Qffioial s .:.i.gnb9ard rp~intained. by me pu;-suant to· 

· subdivision 6 of Section 30 of the Town Law, a Notice of Public 

was part of an order adopted by the Town Board of 

!;he S~h - day. of Oecef9ber, - 1~95 ~ 

A true and correct copy of such Notice of Public Hearing is 

me this 6th day 
1995. 

l' 

PUblic 
' ' ~ . ' 

\ ' 

~· ' J ,, 
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12/5/'95 Adopted 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

RESOLUT!ON #7Bl 
Adopted December 5, 1995 

At1i'llORIZES THE SUPERVISOR TO ExECUTE AND SUBMIT A GRANT 

1510 

. AP!LICATION ·TO SOFFOLI( COUNTY FOR COMMONI'TY .DEVELOPMENT BLoCK 
GRANi' I'OJIDS 

offere.d the following x;esolution, 

· ~icfi wa~ seconded by OOUNCI'LWOMAN GILLIAM 
WHEREAS, the Town of Riverhead annually requests Community 

De11elopment Block Grant funds from the United States Department 
o~ Housing and Urban Development fo:t benefit to low and moderate 
income persons and for the prevent .ion of slum and blight; and 

· WHEREAS, the Town of Riverhead has complied with the citizen 
Patti.cipatian requiremeflts of the Community Development Block 
Grant Program; . and . . . 

. WHEREAS, t.h.~ Town of Riverhead poss~sses the legal authori~y 
to make a grant applicai;ion and to execute a community 
development -arid housing program. 

THE~FORE BE IT RESOLVED, that . the . Town Board her:eby 
authorizes the Supervisor to execute and submit a grant 
apPlication to the Suf'folk County Department 'of · Community 
0Qve~opmept as. grantee of Community ,Development Bl:ock Grant fund·s· 
from the United States Department , of Housing and Url;:>an 
Development; and . 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that upqn apprqvaJ. py tbe gr:antor,; 
Town Board authorizes the Supervisor to execute the required 

aqre,roent between Suffo~k County a.nd th·e Town of Riverhead and to 
undertake the program . as .approved. · · 

AND BE IT FURll'fiER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is liet·eby 
directed to prov.ide a cert,ified copy of this resolution t ·o J oseph 
Sanseverino , Suffolk county Community Development .Q..lfM'.t.Q.r and 
Andrea ~J:;ohneiss, CommunitY' Development Oir~ctor · . 1118 ~/ . 

. . Yet .. NO,Iiil • 
·~ ves'I2: NO •.• ' ,, 

',, 

strut Yei ~ No urr. 

y~~ No . AIU 



Adopted 
TOWN OF RIVER-HEAD 

RESOLUTI'ON # 7 a 2 
-..,....:..-.:....;::~---,..-~ 

ADOPTED:___,..,.~~~-.,..._...;;;-

AUTHORIZAnON TO REPUBLISH BID 
9 t' 

' •I 

I 

"' 

., 

., . 

1511 

GpUNCILWOMAN GIU.IAM OFFERED THE FOLCOWING RESOLUTION 

WtiiCH WAS SECONDED -BY COUNCIL~~ CR-E~GHT\1'1 

Wl;fEAEAS, th.e bid for CHeMICALS was recelveB., ope_ned and· read aloud on 1he 

28th day o' November, 1995 at 11 :1 ~ a m., in the Town Clerk's .office; and . 

' ~ . 

. WHEREAS, there was eltJ:ler one or no bids rec~lved ~on the following Chlmfeals: 
\ I ' • ' 

1. METHANOL 
. . 2. FERRIC CHLORIDE 

3~ POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE., , 
I > 

' ,, 

HOW,·THI!REFORI, B·E IT : 

RESOL¥EDt that the Towr. Board hereby autftorttes · : the · :rown Clerk ' to 
\l'ladvert..- for sea.led Bids for OHEMIOALS (REBID). for use by the ·T·own· · of 
Rtvemead. , · 

. ' ' ' . 

R~LVED, tbat t~e Town Cler~be, a~d bereb)l, Is, authorl~ed to forward a, oopy. 

Of this Resolution ·to all DeJ¥trtments.. .{ 
• ' \ ' I 

I , 

I I • ~ ~ 

( ' 

' ' .. 

' ' 

I > 



.... \ 

TOWN Of RIVERHEAD 

N<?TICE TO BJDDERS {REBID) 

)\ 'H! 

... ,, 

\, 

' \ 

151 2 

~aled bids for t~e purchase of. CHE~ICALS (REBID) for use by tile Town .of 
' ' 

RWerhead will be received by the town Clerk at To.wn Hall, ~00 Howell A.venue, 

Riverhead, New ¥ ork, 11901, until 11 :0~ a.m. on December 28, 1. 995.. . . 
' , ~· £ ' E 3 

·., 
, ' 1 • I f !:,} ·~' ' ~ 

Bid pickets, Including Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk'!t office 
'• 

· at Town Hall Monday· through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m. 

Aft bids must be submitted ·on·the' bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to 

the Spectflcatlons must be listed on a separate sheet · of paper, bearing the 
d.eslgnatlon "EXCEPTIONS TO ~HE SPECIFICATIONSn and be attached 1o fha bid 

Jo~ . , 
., '• 

' : 

The Town Soard tes•rves the right and respons.ibillty to f.e)ect any or atl bJds or 
< 

to walv~ any for:mallty If It believe$ s~ch .· action to be ~n the be$1 Interest of -tile 
rown.. 1 ,. ., ., > 

(!'. 

~ . 

''• 

' ' . . ' 

a sealed envelope bearing the, deslgn~Qon 
' !C • • ~ 

'1.~· ' 

. BY QRDER 0~ THE TOWN BOARD 
OF THE .. TOWN OF RIVERHeAD 

' ' 

Barb~u~a Gra.ttan.:t;own Clerk 
I" 



' ' 

' . ' 

Adopted 
' ' 

TOWN OF RI~RHEAD 

• ·c 

IXTENDS CONTRACT FO'R OFFICE SU·PPLIES,:FU.RNITURE & EQUIPMENT 

COlJNCftMAN P~U§~,. . offered tl"\.e following r~solut.:lon, which was · 
seconded by_ ~y:~~ ,, STARK : · . . 

, WHERE'AS, tlie Piircliasi.ng Department bas requested the contract witb 

lllll'lll.,.,'":''&r.~ ,OFFICE SUPPLY, 1NC., McCABES OFFICE PRODUCTS CO, INC. and LEGEND 
' \ 

FURNITURE orlglnaDy awarded under Resolution . #796 of the Town Board_ adopted 
uuary ·l8, 1994, b~ extebdefl to March 3f, 1996; an·d 

' •' 

' ' ' 

, . WHEREAS·~ CENTRAL OFFICE SUPPLY, ~NC., McCABES. OFFJCE 

''RODUCTS CO, INC. and LEGEND OFFICE FURNITURE has agreed. to exten(l. tbe bJd for an 
'Hdonal3 ~onths; and . " . 

' ' 

I 

~REAS, the T,Q~ Board ,has revi~w~ said request. 

. NOW, THEREFORE, . 'E IT JlESOLVEJ>, that tbe contract for Offlce Supplies, 

'rftlture and Equipment be, and hereby Js, extended to M•r.cb 31, 1996; and . · -
~ l_l ., ' 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, t:hat the T~wa Clerk be, and hereby. .ts~ dtreC:ted to 

bard a Certlfl.ed Copy; of this ~esotution w CENTRAL OFFICE SUPPLY, IN·C., M:tCABitS 
' . 

P~6DUCT.S CO. INC., and &EGEND OFFieE FURNITURE, and all T·own: HJdl. 
' ' . 

. ·,. 

' ) ' ,, 

'l 

~~ · 

,. 



, DECEMBER 5, 1995 

Adopted· 1514 

'tOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
~ 

'· ' .. 

llESOLUTION # 7 8 4 

. ' 

•,· 

AJ!PQIISTS PART-TIME HOMEMAKER FOR mE E.l.S~E.P. PROGRAM 
,, 

~""" ' 

. CCUNCILMAN .STARK 
,.....,...,....~~--.,..,.;;.__....,...._....__,;....~........._-----.:-~OFFERED. THE FOLLOWING RES·OLUTIO'N 

. WHICH WAS SECONDED BY ' : COUNCILMAN PRVSINOWSKJ 

1 • ' 

" 

. WHEREAS, due to the Jesignation of Lorna Stokely, the position of part-titne homemaker 
exists~ the E.I.S.R.P. ~ro~. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT' RESOLVED, that, at the re~ommendation of the E.l.8.E.P. 
Ad.J;nbUs~tion, Joann Ziln.icki .is hereby app~inted to the position of part-time homemaker fm 
the E.I.S.E.P. Progr;am at~ l\ourlyrate of$7"'3904, eff~q,~e luuar:y 2; 1996; and 

BE IT FURTHER JtESOL VED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized to 
forward .certified copy of this resolution to ~oann Zilnicki, and the Office of Accounting. 

'•' 

' 
... - ..... -~-

Gilham 
·-·~. 

-fruslnQw$td 

The Resolution .fs tberefote 
&lctated duJy aet:>pted 

... _ ~--
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' -~ J, 

Adopted 
'. 

' . 

AWARDS 810 FOR .fOOD 
' 

•' ' 

F.lESOlLUTION # 78 5 
•\ 

. ' 
ADOPTED: __,....,.---=-.....-..,._...,__,...,.........._ 

,, 

'b: .~ ; "' 

CO\/NCIL'M;.'-1 CBEtGMfC~ offered ttle followlng resolution, 
' . 

· wlllch Wa~ seconded by~ ,._ . ..COUNGILWOMAN-Gil+.JAM-· - · 

. Wli~REAS. the T:own ~·Clerk was. authorized to publ19h and· post a Notice To , 
8klcleni for FOOD; and . · .. · . ' 

WHEREAS, bids were rec~lvett, opened· and read aloJ.ld ·on the 30th day of . 
. Octy ober, 1995,-. at ·11:05 a .. m. at Town Hall~ 200 Howell Avenue, Alverhead, ,New 

ork 119()1, th' date, tlme ·and place given In the Notice To· Bidders. · · 

NOW, THEREFORE, B~ ·It .,. 
I ' 

t I " • ' . 

. RESOLVED, that the bid for F!OOD be awarded to· LANDMARK FOOD CORP.· 
~PHILLIP VEtt~Rl INC. as t·ndlcated on the. attached sheets. labeled "fill> 

AD FOR FOOD . , . ... . · 
• ~ ' I 

• 11'!. 

ft~LV£0, that the Town Board hereby directs the ·rown Clerk to return any 
Ill all bid ~onds recei~e(t ~n connection ~ith the .above .. , · · · · 

Cwa~VED, that the Town Clerk be, an<l ftereby is, 'authotlz8d tO tOrward a 
atA , Copy. of. this Resolution ·to ·!AND·MARK FOOD CORP., PftiLUP·V.J!TTER 
Wl\1., ~· NutrlttOQ c,nter.and tht Accounting Department..... . . I . • ' 

"' 

. . 9 

' ,, 

' ., 

The R*JYffon fs.lhemtom 
d8CiatBd au:y ~.ttopted 

f • 

' ' 



FOOD 

DESCR~PT!ON 

)9028 APPL.J!!S I FRESH (MA€) 
39354_ APl?L~S, S,LICED., CAN 
39354 APRICOT HALVES 
19028 BANANAS, FRESH{40LB) 
19380 BASIL . . . . 

'· 39380 BAY LEAF 
- 19387 l3EAN SPROUTS .. CAN 

l9049. BEEF, STEW 
l9084 BEETS I SiriCED 

, 17515 .BISCUITS, OVEN READY 
~1 515 BREAD CRUMBS, ITALIAN 
!9084 BROCCO~.I. SPEARS, FROZEN (3L'B. PKG.) 
)908.4 BROCOLLI, CHOl?PEP, FRO.ZE~N ( 2 • 5LB. PKGS. ) 
~9084 BROSSEL SPROUTS 1 FROZEN ( 2 • SLB .• . PKGS . ) 
iatllO BU'l'TER PATTIES (IND. ) 
!8010 BUTT2R SOLIDS (1LB) 
i9084 CABBAGE (24CT) 
~9084 CABBAGE, RED 
}9380 CAJUN SPICE 
!8.512 CAKE MIX~MODE·RN MA!D, YE.LtOW(-5LB BOX) 
l!Sl2 CA~E .. , BROWNIE I SHEE'f , FROZEN 
i8512 ~K~, C,JU\RQT I S.HEET t FROZEN 
f8512 CAKE, CR~, SHEET, FROZEN 
.S512 CAKE,POUND {lLB.EACH). 
i&512' CAKE, R.ASPB'ERRY, SHEET, FROZEN . 
~~028 CANTELOUPES 
,9084 CARROTS , DICED, FROZEN ( 2 ~ 5 LB . PKG. ) 
9084 CARROTS , ·FRESH · 
:9084 CAULIFLOWER, FROZEN·(2LB. PKGS : ) 

, :9084 CELERY STALI<S (PRICE PER l'3UN'CH) 
!9l35 CEREAL I BRAN FLAKES ( IND:. ) 
:n35 CEREAL, CORN FLAKES (IND ) 
~335 . CEltEAL, CREAM Q~ WHEAT 
9335 CEREAL, OATMEAL. 
&335 CEREAL, RAISIN BRAN (IND.) KELLOGGS 

· ;335 CEREAL, SPECIAL "K•• '( INn~) I<ELLOGGS 
! 335 CER2Aii, 'tOASTED OATS (IND. ) 
;lt>07 CHEESE, 1\MER!CAN (LOAF) { S LB) 
j)O O~ CHEBSE, COTTAGE · 
~007 CHEESE' MOZZARELLA ( 5 I LB·) 
~ 007 CHEI!\SE ,, PARMESAN, LMPORTEO 
: 007 CH~E~E,RICOTTA 
.. , 028 CHERatES 
! 387 CHILI (50 OZ.) 
~rlao ~HILI POWDER 
ll380 CINNAMON .. . 
! 340 COFF·EI· ( lLB. PKGS . f 
llltO COFFEE, DEeAF ( lLB .. PKGS . ) 

ltO COFFeR, SANRA, ( :IN'O. ) ( 5Pt<GS / 100 t 
~0~~ COLLARD GREENS l FROZEN ( 3 L"B ~· PKG S . ) 
-~J084 CORN, WHOLE KERNEL, 

1516 

'QriiT 
AMOUNT 4ANDMARK VE~TER 

lOOCT. 
6/10 
6/10 
CASE 
240Z 
100& 
6/10 

LB 
6/10 

120/CASE 
6/SLB 

' 12/CASE 
12·/CASE 
12/CASE 

47CT/17ltB 
36/CAS,.E' 

SOLB/CASE 
6/lO 
140Z 

6/CASE 
. 3/SOOZ 
3/840Z 

3/24CUT 
12/CASE 
3/24Ctrr 
18/CASE 
12/CASE 

6/lLB 
12/CASE 

·aONCH 
96CT 

96/CASE 
.12/28021 
l2/480Z 
72/CASE 
72/CA.SE 

$6CT 
LB 

. StB TUB 
LB 

5LB 'I'UB 
3LB 

i GAu 
12/CASE 

16 pz 
1.4.0Z 

22/CASE 
22/CASE 

CASB 
12/CASE . 

~ 6/ 10 

$24.47 
$1.78 

. $21.65 
$10.86 

$11.87 
$17.50 
$16.52 

$31 .. 69 
$3!f. 27 
$37.90 
$40.95 
$35.62 
$45.70 

,, 
$16.50 

$19.92 
$'19. 11 
$33.82 
$23 . 07 
$2·4 "06 
$25 . 95 
$19.9.'2 

$5 ~ 90 

$.4&. 90 

' ·~ •. 6.0 ;se.s2 
.. $94.)9 
$46.36 

' $18.49 

$14 75 
$25 .. 90 
$36. 00 
$18~50 

$7 ." 50 
$6.50 

.$15. 95 

.23.75 
$42.84 
$12.00 
.26 "75 

$5 . 5-0 

$25.00 
$10 .. 56 
$0.50 · 

$1.00 

$1 .. 75 

$1 . 82 
$1$.00 
$3. 67 

$12. 5 0 

$l ·~ so 
$4 .. 00 . 

$14'.50 



AWARP FO~ FOOD ' ' 

' ' 

CLASS ., 
COD! · DIDSCRIPTION 

~ 

39049 CORNED BEEF BRISKE~-COOKED/RAW 
j9343 CRACKERS, PREMIUM UNSALTED 
19348 CRANBERRY SAUCE, OCEAN SPRAY (JELLIED) 
390·84 CUCUMBERS (SLB) 
38512 DANISU, ASSTD. , FROZEN, -WRAPPED 
39348 D(iESSI;NG, QAESAR, CREAMY: (GAL .• JARS) 
39348 D~SSING, COLESLAW (GAL. JARS.) 

' 19348 DRESSING I I'TALIAN ( 4- GAL. J~RS) ' 
3~348 DkESSING, ITALIAN, CREAMY (GAL, JARS) 
l902l EGO PRODUCT, FROZEN (5LB. C'ONTAINERS) 

. 3~021 EGGS, LARGE 
39028 FILLING- BLUSB~RRY 

' 8546 FISH CAKES 
8546· FISH, TUNA, LARGE CAN (66 ~· 1/20Z) 

18546 FISR 1 'FLOUNDER, 'PRECOOKl!!D, BREADED 
~854~ F.lSH, SEA GRILL I PLA.IN , FROZ:EN ( 40Z) 
l93 ~ 1 FLOUR . 
liS96 FRENCH FRIES,. FROZEN f OVENCOOKED· ·( 5LB) 

, !8506 FREliCH TOAST 
' 39·354 FRUIT COCK'tAIL . 

39354 FRUIT SALAD M!DLEY , 
9354 .FRUIT SALAD, TROPICAL 

3938Q GARIJIC J?OWD:SR 
391.3 GRAHAM CRACKER CR\VMB S .( 1 Q vB .. BAG) 
9348 GRAVY MASTER 
~~48 GRAVY I BEEF, CAMPBELL's {SlOZ. CANS) ' ' 
l!lt,8 ~VY 1 CHICltEN 1 CAMPBELL' S ( 510Z. CANS) 
39348 GRAVY* TURKEY ( LEGAUT} 
90_.9 HASH, CORNED BmEF 

i9327 HOT. CHOCO~TE, NES-TLES { 50ENV /BOX) 
9385 ICED TEA MIX, NESTEA . 

r596 !TALI AN BEANS, FROZEN ( 2 _ 1/2LB. PKG. ) 
·' 3•6 JEGLO , CITRUS 
1934P J2LLO• RED 240Z 
l!l59 JELLY, GRAPE ( 4 LB) -
:;~9 JEI;I,. Y, GlUI.PE (INDIVIDUAL} {ASSTD 1 , 59 ) 

vO JUICE, APPLE {460Z) 
i:;oo· Jl.Jtct I APPLE < 66z} 

00 JUICB,CRMmERRY(460Z) 
~i~ JOICI!It C~1!:RRY ( 60Z) 
lJa~c ~ICE, (lRAPB. (460Z) 
l9j vulCE . GRAPE(6(;)Z} 

393:~ JtJlCE, GRAPEFRUIT { 4 60Z) 
l'l JuiCE, GAAPEFRUIT ( 60Z) 
l~l~~ tlUIC&,.OPl\NGE .. FROZEN ( 40Z: } 
~9l1JO VUICE~ ,PtNEAPPLE {460Z') · 
~llte \)UICPt , TOMATO, SACRAMEWfO (460Z) 
l'lte ~CHUP (INPlVIDUAL) -. 
las, «E'rCtttJJ.) f 1\EINZ 
33~6~ kiDNEY BEANS ('6LB. CANS) 
~ l LASI\GNA, VkGETABLE, STOUFF'ERS 

1517 

UNiq' 
AMOUlfr _ LANDMARK VflrTBR · 

LB 
.SE/300 2,PK 

6/10 
SLB 

24CT 
· 4/CASE 

4/CASE 
CASE 

4/CASE. 
6/CASE. 

30DZ/CASE 
6/10 

360/CASE 
6/CASE 

lOLB/CASE . 
407CASE 

25LB BAG 
·6/CASB) 
9-6/CASE 

6/10 
4/lGAL 

6/10 
180Z 

·lOLB .. BAG 
12/Q'r/CS 
12/CA~E 
12/CAS! 

' 12/#9 
6/10 

6aOX/CASE 
24/l60Z 
12/CASE 
12/CASE 
12/CAS"t 

6/CASE 
200/CA_$E 

12/CASE 
48/CA E 
12/CASE 
48/CASE . 
12/ CASE 
48 / CASE 
12/ CASE 
48/CASE 
48 / CAS·E 
12/CASE 
12/~SE 

1000/CASI=! 
~/10 

6/ eASB 
4/ 96· 

$1.49 ' 

$13.26 

$3lt 84 

$66 ~ 13 

$34.70 
$44.80 

$18~16 

$31 . 50 

.16 .. 61 
$75,20 

$24 ~ 82 
$16.32 
$11.41 
$21 . 41 

$7 . 29 

.18 0> 6·6 

$21 ~ 84 
$16 . 28 

$10 . 9{) 
.f3 ·5 .. 50 

$.1 .. S0 

$35.9$ 
$23.00 
$21.00 
$21.95 

$27.00 
$46.50 

$).6 ~ 00 

$5.50 
$13 . 90 

$28 ~ 55 

$')5 . '80 
$'3 .75 

$18.50 
$23.50 

· $25. !IS 
$49 ~ 50 
$31 .50 

$l1.&0 

fl 2 .15 
$'12.?5 

$15.50 

$1 4 "9'0 
$1~.~5 

$ 4 .. 95 
j l l. 20 ' 
$18 ,70 
:$'18 . ! '0 
f.l~ ~ 95 
4 8 ~ 00 



' ' 

DESCRIPTION 

)93£>0 LEMON JUICE 
l9360 LEMONADE MIX, PI$ 
J9G84 LE'l'TUC 1£ I I c BBERtl 
J9384 W:MA BEANS,ltROZE,N(250Z/PKG} 
19361 MACARONI I ~LBOW 
;9361 MACAR'0NI, SHELLS , MEDIUM 
39361 MACARONI , TR:t: -COLOR 

. 191(1 MANICOTTI', CELENTANO 
.39348 MAYQNNAIS~ (:tND)· NUGG~T 
H348 MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S 
· l64 MILK, EV·APORATED 

15 MUFFXN MIX, BLUEBERRY (5LB. PKG'S.) 
39084 MUFFIN MIX I CORN ( 5LB. PKGS. ~ MM DE:LUXE 
}9084 MUSll{tO'QMS , CAN 
39348 MUSTARD, GULDEN I s 
393-t8 ' MOS1.'ARD I GULDEN's (INDIVIDUAL) 
3B61 NOODLES I LASAGNE ' 
l9361 NOODLES I ZITI 
19361 NOODLE'S, CHOW MEIN 
39361 OOODLES, EGG 
:U361 NOODLES I MEDIUM 
3H61 NOODLES·, SPIRAL 

384 NUTMEG 
384 OLIVES, GREEN ( 12 5CT) 

9380 ONION POWDER 
384 ONIQNS ' ·PEARL, CANN~D 

C ONION'S ',SPAN!SH,FRESH 
48 ORANGES 1 ,MAN[)ARI.N (~3 -l/20Z. CANS) 

9l48 ORANGES I FRESH 
l9l80 OREGANO 

346 PJillCAKE, J;>OwtrrFLA;l<E. . 
PARSLEY FLAKES 

. 34A PEACHES, FRESH- LAAGE I 3 9'LBS . 
J9348 PEACHES, SLICED 

· ;szss PEANUT BUTTER, SKIPPY (SLB.) 
·9148 PE~R Hl\L~S. . 

84 PEAS , FROZ { 2 • 5 LB • PKG . ) 
. 3&4 P~ ·Pl>'ER"' BLACK 
:9384 PEP,PERS, FRESH GREEN 
;9369 PICKLES, DlLL · 
, l69 PICKLES·, DILL, CH·IPS- B&J ( l<lAL"" JARS) 
'$3 3

3
46 PIES 1 MRS "SMITH • APPLE .( 1 0· n . 

~~ PINEAPPLE CHlJN}(S . 
~:i4 PlNEAP~LE, SI,ICfm 
~1\ 4 PLUMS I WHO'LE PURPLE 
'BSI9 ~OT PIS, t3JBEF 
• t4 POT PIE, CliiCKEN . . 
18 roTATO CHIPS (VENDING) .. 
[Sg~ POTAT01 HASH BROWN PATTY 

POTATOES I DICED 
• POTI\TOBS I F'RE'SR., IDAHO 

4/30/96 

151 ~ 

ONIT 
AMOUNT LANDMARK VETTER 

12QTS/CASE 
l2/240Z 
24/CAS~ 
12/CASE 

2.0LB 
20LB 
lOLB 

80/2 ~ 40Z 
200CT/CASE 

CASE/4GAL 
ASE/48TALL 

6/CASE 
6/CASE 

6/10 
CASE/4GAL 

500/CASE 
lOLa/BOX 
20-LB BOX 

4/SLB Ttij3 
lC)LB sox· 
lO~B BQX 
20LB BOX 

l:60Z 
lGAL 
190Z 
6/10 

2SLB BAG 
6/CASE 

100/CASE 
160Z 

96/CASE 
80Z 

CASE 
6/10 

6/CASE 
6/1'0 

~2/<:;ASE 
160Z 

25LBS 
4GAL/CASE 

4/CAS!£ 
6/CAS~ 

6/10 
6/lG 
6/10 

24/1oz 
.24/?0Z 

60CT 
1201G:)iSB 

6/10 
lOOCT 

$16.87 

$~5.93 
$9.78 

$3 ·4. 78 

$26.13 

$13.47 

$·29. 84 
$.8 .. 6'5 

$24.55 
$16 .48 

$11.57 
$5 ... 62 

$42.28 
$22 .· 96 
$.16 •. tJS 

$19.20 
$23.97 

$18.97 
$18~97 
$11.85 
$13.52 ' 

$18.50 

$15. 7·5 
$30 ~00 

$0. 92 
$12.20 
.14.5Q 
$10.15 

$35.50 

$27.75 
$2?.50 
$38.95 
.21.75 
.$11. 75 

$8 .. 75 
$11~70 

$8.50 
$8~50 

$12 .. 75 
$5'.75 

$4.25 

$28.00 
$.27 ~50 

$4.50 
$20.00 
t12,50 
$11 : 75 

$21.50 
$'22. 60 

' t '26, 15, 
$'17.89 
.11*89 

.$.l2 ~ 60 



FOOD 

' ' 

GLASS 
CODE DESCRIPTION 

39387 ;J?O'l'ATOES 1 INSTAN!P ·. 
}8596 POTATOES I SLICED 
l9084 ~OT'ATOES I SWEET ' YAMS 
19084 POTATOES I WHOr.,E {70- 80CT) 
l9346 PUDDING, CHOCOLATE 
l9346 PUDDING, TAPIOCA . 
39346 PUDDING, VANILLA 
~9360 l?UNCH, fRU~T (460~ CANS} 
l9lS3 RAISINS 
l93~1 RA VIOI.Jt, CANNED . 
19361 RAVIOLI I CHEESE, FROZEN 
39369 RELISH 
l9369 RELISH (INDIVIDUAL) 
l9 3 7'2 kl: CE P'l: LAF 
39)72 RICE, WILD {360Z .. PKG"') 
39'372 RICE, UNCLE BEN'S 
37515. ROLLS, PINNER . 
31515 ROLLS, HOT DOG ( 12PKG.) 
39069 SALAD I TH;REE BEAN 
39370 SALT 
,9380 SALT 1 SEAS6NED 
39348 SAUCE,APPLE 
l9f48 $1\:UCE I !3ARBEQUE ( 4- GA.L .. JARS) OPEN PIT 
39348 SAUCE, CHEESE, CAMP13ELL' S 
393~8 ·sAUCE, ~OY ( lGAL ~) 
~9348 $AUCE, SEAQH.ETT.I 
l9348 SAUCE,TOMATO 
l9348 SAUCE f WORCESTERSkiRE (1GM. ) 
38546 SCROD,NEW ENGLAND STYLE(lOLB.PKG .. } 
l8S46 ·SEA ·LEG· SUPREME 
l8546 SEA NUGGETS, OVEN READY 
~936·1 SHELLS, STU'F'FED,MEDIUM 
l9l78 .SOUP BASE,CREAMED,KNORR 
19378 SOUP 1 BEEF BARLEY ,CAMPBELLS (LG) (510Z) 
93]8 SOUP,BEEF . NOODL~,CAMPBELLS(SM) (7~250Z) 

19378 SOUP,CHICKEN & RICJ£1CAMPBELLS (SM) (7 .250Z 
)9~78 ,SOUP 1 Cl!.IC~N. NOODL:E,CAMPBELLS(LG) (510~) 
!9)78 SOUP,CHICKEN NOODLE,CAMPBELLS(SM) (7.250Z 
t9 l7 8 ·SOUP ., CLAM CROWD~ M.MmATT.AN', CAMP • '( LG) (51 OZ 
)9l'i8 SOUP I CREAM/CELE~Y ~CAMPBELL$ {LG} (5l0Z) 
i318. $0UP, C~~AM/MUSHROOM, C1\MPBELLS {'tG} (510~) 
9378 SOUP, S~LIT PEA, .CAMPB~LLS(LG) (510Z) 
&:Olo SOuR C~EAM . .. 
~9l48 ~OY SAUGE (lQAL .JAR} . I 

9361 SPAGHETTI#LONG . 
8596 SPINACM,CN02P.ED,F80Z(3LB.PKG.) 
lS96 SQUASH I YELLOW, SL1C!D, FROZEN ( 3LB. PKG" 
9 3,4 2 STARCH·, OORN 11:16 . 
&S49 STRAWBE·RRIES, SLICED, FROZEN (6. SOZ) 
as,6 ern·rNa BmANs, REG. cuT, FROZ <2. SLB·-- PKG . > 
~01_2 STUFFIJ:lG, UNCLS BEN'S { lLB . BAGS) 

IPF!CTI"VE THROUGH 4/30/96 
\< 

1519 

"' UNIT 
AMOUNT LAIID~RK VETTER 

6/10 
6/10 . 
6/10 
6/l~O 
6/10 
6/10 
6/10 

12/CASE 
30LBS 

6/10 
. 300CT 

4GAL/CASE 
200/CASE 

6/360Z 
, 6/CASJE) 
25LB BAG 
144/CASE 

12/CASE 
6/10 

24/260Z 
2LB 

6/10 
CASE 

12/#5 
4/CASE 

·6/10· 
6/10 . 

' 4/CASE 
6/CASE 

SLB/BbX 
lQLB/CASE ." 

96CT 
6/2LB 

12/CASE 
24/CASE 
24/CASE 
12/CA·SE 
24./CASE 

. 12/CASE 
12/CASE· 
12/CASE 
12,{CA$E 

SLB.CONT. 
4/CA$E 

20LB BOX 
12/CASE 
12/CASE 
24/CASE 

6/CASE 
CASE/ 12PK 

6/ CASE 

$11 .. 92 

$12 ~'SO 

$14 .55 
$37.50 

$11.27 
$16.67 

$22 .. 47 
$41. ·eo 
$14.87 
$14.97 
$15~16 

$5.61 
$16 .. 30 

$'18.96 

$42.70 
$'1 ·5. 73 
$'25.84 
$24.30 
$$2. 77 
$41.77 
NO BID 
NO BID 

Nt> BID 

$39 .. 79 
$12.55 
$24.85 

$24.95 

$17 . 75 

$18.50 
$19.75 
$18,50 

$26.50 

. $?.40 

$24 .. 45 
$9' .. . 95 

$32.75 
$'39. '5 
$21.55 

$·14" 50 
$10.00 

NO BID 
NO BID 
$27.70 

$34. ·40 
$21 .. 40 
$30.20 
$31 .. 70 

$3.75 
$'21.35 
$12 .. 50 
.$1 ·9 "so 
$23. 40 
$1'2 .. 50 



AWARD FOR FOOD 

DESCRIPTION 

3938.1 SUGAR ( 5LB. PKG . ) 
. 393Q1 SUGAR (IND.} 

39381 SUGAR,l3ROWN (lLB . PKG.) 
39381 SW£ET &: L.QW(2PKG/1250} 
39382 SYRUP, MAPLE I IND. J?KG. 
39382 SYRUP,, PANCAKE ( lGAL.) 
393~4 TEA, DECAF (IND. ) { PKG/ 100 ~ 
}9364 TEA - LIPTON 
39384 rHYME 
)~ 378 TOMATO PASTE 
19386 TOMATO EURBE 
i9386 TOMATOES, B~EFSXEAK 

· 'l9386 TOMATO~S t CHERRy; 
!93SG TOMATOES, <;RUSHED 
39084 TOMATOES, WHOLE 
·38596 TURNIPS, FROZEN (2 .. 5LB.PKG . ) 
l93 4a VANILLA FLAVORING (IMITATION) 
39375 VEGETABLE OIL ( G.AL . JARS) 
l93'8 8 VINEGARt WHITE (lGAL) 

' 38556 WAFFLES I DOWNYFLAKE 
l9028 WAT~RMELON (WHOLE) X - LARGE 
18596 WAXED BSANS, FROZEN . (3LB. PKG . ) 
s803 0 WHIPPED CREAM, EVERFRESH .{ lSOZ). 

' !8090 YOGURT,:ALL LOW FAT,FLAVORS 
,9361 ZITI, BAKED, 5i6 FROZEN 
~084 ZUCCH~I & TOMATOES . 
i859 6 zuecHINI, SLICED, FROZEN ( 3 LB. PKG) 

!PiECTIVE THROUGH 4/3 0 /9 6 

!520 

UNIT 
.~ . 

AMOUNT LANDMARK VETTER , 

1_2/CASE 
2000CT 

24/CA~E 
CASE 

100/ CASE 
4/CASE 
5/ CASE 
10/100 

280Z 
6 / 10 
6/10 

LB'. 
12/ PT 

6/ 10 
6/10 

12/CASE ' 
1QT 

6/CASE 
4/ CASE 

96 / CASE 
EACH 

12/CASE 
12 / CA.SE 

. 1.2 / SOZ 
SLB/ BOX 

6/ 10 
12/ CASE 



J?J5/95 

j 

Adopted 
1521 

'I 

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

Resolution # 9 8 6 

' ' ~\ 

DENIES BED & BREAKFAST AP!LlCAriON OF VIRGINIA T~DA.IIL 

' ' 

_ ,COUNCILW9MAN .. GI~!Jl\Moffered the following resQiution, was seoonded by 

flOUNCll'YJA.~ CRE~GHT~'I 

WIIEREAS,.a special perm.it applieat1on~ pursuant to Section 108-15 {C) {2} of the To,vn 
Code, was submitted by Virginia Trandaql to estat?lisb a Qed.&. breakfast facility ou a .94 acre 
parcel zoned Residence .. C", which lot is located on the northwest int~rsection ofPeconic Bay 
.Boulevard and Lagoon Court, Jamesport,' New York, known as designated as Suffolk County 
Tax Map #0600-SS ... 2-15; and 

Wll EREAS, the Planning Department has reviewed the special permit apptication; and 
' , ' 

·l ' 

WfiER·EAS, a public hearing wa~ hetd before the Town Board on the 8th day of 
Nov_emb~r, 1995, to hear aU interested individ,uals in favor of <;>r oppo$ed to the application of 
Virginia'Trandahl to establish a bed & breakfast ~ and 

W·liEREAS,~ the Town B:oard has reviewed the special permit application and has 
t.ons.idere-d the t~stimony and exhibits introduced at tb.e publiq bearing on November 8~ J 995 . . 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the special pennit application of 
Virginia Tntndaht be a:nd is hereby denied by ,the Town Beard, wl11ch denia·l is based upon · 
.€ovenants and Restrictio~$ filed QY Mohring Enterprises,. In<;. at the Suffolk County Clerk:s Office 
on the 31st day ot August, 1982, which Covenants and Restrictions provide in pertinent part: 

. , ''No 'ot sbaU be used or tnaintained for any purpose other than a one-family residetlce .• ,. ~ 
and 
h·l\fo trade or busi~ess shaH be conducted on any lot·· ~ and be it further 

. RESOLVED~ that the Town Clerk be and is hereby dire~ed t:o fotWard a certified copy 
of this resolution to Virginia Trandaht, the Pt~nning Department and ~be Building J?epartJnent. 
· · · Ttre Vote 

' Gilliam Y$8~ No . 
~ . 1! *!4 · c,.,. Yes • • No,.._. _.. 

~ , . . vAL No_..... 
PlUSinowskf Yvs ~ No._..._... 

The Resolution ls tteretore 
declared au~v adootea 



ed 
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. TOWN OF RJVEIUfEAD 

RESOLUTION# 797 
1\DO,PTED:~__..,... ______ _ 

. ,AWARDS DIP FOR BABE MOUNTED LIGHT POLES, BRACKETS AND fiXTVRES 
" 

OOUNCI~AN .PRU~INOW,SKJ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION 

wn1cn wAs sEctJNDED BY --.;;_~r ......... .~c~. Lfii//U.'N...:l,;l~C~t~LM~AI=\i~N~s,...t""AQ,RKA.-=--___,_.: 

· ·WHEREAS, t~e To~f! Clerk was authorized to. publish and ·post a Notice· to Bidders for 

WHEREAS, bids we.re receivw, opened and read. aloud on ·the J.Oth (lay of October, l99S 
• oc. ' ' .f 

at ·11:15 a.m. by tlte Town Clerk of tbe Town or Ri~erbead at Town HJJII, 200 Rowell 

Aven""e, Riverhead, New Yor~ 1190l, the date, time and place .given in the Notice ttl 

SOW.THEREFORE, PE IT 

, · ki:sOL\'ED, that tbe Town ·Board hereby dlTects the To\vn Clerk to return. ,any a~d all bid 
... 

botlds received In conoeetion the abe\'e. 

· · BElT FURTHER RESOLVED, tftat the Town Clerk be, and hereby,, is autbomed to 

IO!'ward ~Cert·lfled Copy of tbts Resotutien to CAPTRE ELECfiUC SUPPLY CO. Jntl all 

·· l'~ Hall Department$. ,,. 



.l.J. •• ) • 

I• ' 

·Ado · 
' ' ~ . TOWN OF FUVERHEAO' 

•' 

AUIHORIZATI.ON JO. PU=B~Ll:::.;;::::.SH~BI~D 

•' 

CCUNCtlMAN STARK 

WtfiCH WAS SECONDED B¥ 

O·FFERED-THE FOLLOWING RlES0lUTION 

COU·NC1LMAN PRUStNOY\ISKI 

' ' 

8E IT RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN BOARD HEReBY AUTHORIZ~S THE TOWN 
. ~ . ' ' 

CLERK TO ADVERTISE FO~ SEALISD -~IDS FQR THI; PURCHASE OF A ·U$EQ. 
' ' ' 

ll6_6, FWD ,MQDEL 86~328 ! :_ AXLE WAECKEA ,FOR USE BY. THE tOWN 0 -F 

RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT. 
' ' ' 

· ' 
r ' 

BE tT FiesQLVeo, THAT THE rowN CL~RK e~, AND. HI!Reev Is, ... AUtHORIZED 
J , ,.; •I " .t. • I ': , _ 

TO ~ORWARD A COPY OF 1lUS RESOLUTI0N {0 ·All DEPARTMENTS. ·. . . '• . 

I I "_.' , •: ,• < 

j • . ' 
' ~ ' ,. 

. "' 

' . 

. '~ 

" 

'it' • 

1523 
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.TOWN <l>F RIVERHEAD 
NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

Staled bids for the purchase of a USED ~966 FWD~ MO,DEL 86-4328 3 AXLE 
' -~ ' , , /! 1 ' ' ,( ~ L 

•• I. • 

WBeCI<EA for use. by,th~ TOWN. OF :R.JVtaRHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTM,ENT ·wtll be 

received t)y the tow~ . Cl.erk ·of the Town of RI1Jerhead at ·Town Hall', 200 Ho·well 

Avenue, Riverhead, New York, 11:901~ · untii11:0D a.m. on ·December 18, 1995 .. 

' . ' ' ·' '· 

Bid packets, lttchJdlng Specfftcatlons, may be obtained at the Town Clerk's office 
t ., ' 

at Town· Hall Monday through Friday between the hours of 8:~0 a.m. and 4:30 p.m. 
• • 1 ~ 

. ' ' 

All btds must be submitted on the bid form provided. Any a~d ~II exceptJo~s t~ 
I 

1 
I ! !f.: 

the ,Specifications must be listed on a. separa•e· sheet of paRtr, bearl.ng the 

designation ''&XC.ER:rtQNS 1:0 T·HE SPECIFICA:TlONS" and. be attached to the bid · 
I ' r • ' -': ~·, \ ' 

fonn •. 

' ,, ' 

' 

The Town··Board l'eserves the right an(f tesponslblllty 1o reJect an or all til<ts or 
• 

to waive any formality If it bette·ves suCh action to be In the best Interest of the 

Town. . ''• 'I 

< ' 

' 

Aft btds are to be submttted 1n a sealed envelope bearing the designation ~~~$ 

' ' ' 
' 

. ~.. . 

. w 

f;J.Y OBDER Of THE tOWN BOA._D 
0 THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

Barbara Grattan, Town Clerk 
' 

' . 

' . 

" ' 

. ' 



.12/5/95. 
Adopted 1525 

II 

. .. ~ 

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
• < 

Resolution # 7 8 9 

~P~ROVf1S SITE PL_AN OF THE REQUERPO COMPANY (DU.NKIN' 
7 

• • ' - - , DONUTS)' . 3 
. 

)', ' ' ~ 

resolution. ·which was seconded by ---..-:-=-~::;;.:.=~3111LLlLa:-J~:..a.LI~ 

. WHERE.AS, a site plaa and elevatiQns were submitted by' Broce Barnet, as agen·t 
for the ltequerdo Comany 1 for the relocation of the main access dQQr t9 Dpnkin' Donuts,. located 
at the· southwest comer of Old Country Road (C.R. 58) and Roanoke Av~nue (C.R. 73)) 
Riverhead, New York, known and designated as Suffolk County Tax Map Number 0600-108-4-
.14.6~ and 

· , _ WHE.R.EAS, the Planning Department has review~ the _plan and elevations, 
.dated May 1995, as prepared by Steven L. Maresca, P.E., S.R. 24 (Flanders Road), Hampton 
Bays NY 1.1946, and.has recommended· to the Town Board of the Town of Riverhead that said 
site plan application be approved; and · · 

·. -;. . 

, - WHEREAS, based' upon the Towri Board's review of the Environmental 
A~essment Fonn and the proceedings had herein, the Town Board determines rbat the site plan 
~plied f()r will be a(n) Typq D Action without a significant impact upon the environment 
p\lrsuant to the State Environmental Conservation baw and 6 NYCRR Part 617; and . 

. WHEREAS, ,a copy of the site plan has been ,marktd and initialled by the' Town 
BoanJ t~ show changes that are funher set forth iu this te~lution, which site plaN shall be ort 
Jetord with the Town Clerk; and -

. WHEREAS; th~site plan review fee, as required by Section t08--l3l B(3) ofthe 
Code ~f !lte Town Qf Riverhead has been received and -deposited as, per Receipt Number 9>2926 

· of the Office of the .s~pervisor pf the Town of Riverhead; and . 

. WHEREAS) this Town ·Board Has reviewed the site plan and elevations · 
afQrementioned.. . . · · 

. ' 
NOW, TllEREFORE, BE IT 

. RESOLVED,. that t.he· site plan an~ elevations submitted by Bruce Barnet~ as · 
agent for th~ Requerdo ~omany, for the relocatiort of. tbtt main ac~ss door ~ Punkin' Donuts. 

' ,. located at tfie southwest comer of Old Country Road (C.R. S8) and Rpanok~ .Ave ue (C,R. ?~}, 
Riverhead, New York, plan and elelvations dated ' May 1995, as prepared by ·steven L. Maresca. 
P.E .• S.R .. 24 (Flanders Road), f.lampton Bays NY 11946, ·be and are hereby approved by tfte 

f Town Board of the Tow g. of Rjv~rhead, sqbj~ct «> tbe follQwing; , . · 

I · t. That the provisions of the Ri'f"erlltad Town COde, which are not addressed. by 
this resolution, or other .offiet_ · a1 aen. ~on. ~f the Tuwn shall • .at ·all .rimes, be complied ·with by the 

1 
· o~er of th~ pfQ.pert)' ~overed by d~JS Sttf·, plan; . . . . ~ " _ · 

' ' 
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' X' 

2: ~at ~ coven~nt ~ontaining all the litnit~tio.ns and pro~sions of these 
approvals contamed m th1s resolution, m a fonn as attached, shall be~recorded with the Suffolk 
Coon~ Clerk .and a copy of s.ucb recorded covenant shall be tiled with the Riverhead Town 
Oerk. This resolution sh~l not become effective utttil .sucb covenant is duly recorded with ttte 
SUffolk COunty Clerk's Office and filed with the Riverhead Town Clerk; . . . 

3. That the form, design, location and color of all signage shall be submitted to 
the Town Board for its tevi~w and approval pursuant to the site plan process and the sign permit 
procedure prior ·to betng ·mstalled at the· ·property; that all signage so proposed shall be 
CO()I'djnated in appearance and design; and that all provisions of Section 108-56 of the 
Ril'erbead Town· Code shall be complied with, and that all tenan~ shall be apprised of said 
,equirements and any restriCtions imposed as a condition o( the site plan approva.I granted herein; 

' ' 

4. No lighting shall be installed or adjusted in sue}), a way as 10 cause direct glare 
bn neighboring properties or adjoining highways; , . 

.. 

. 5~ That the applicant is familiar with tbe Riverhead Town Code, Chapter 96, 
~ded, ••Trash, Rubbish and Refuse Disposal", and Chapter 98, prohibiting the accumqlation of 
lttter, and requiring the enclosure Of dump·sters, and agrees to abide by same; 

· , · 6. That receptacles of a decorative design, approved by the Planniog Department 
prior to their installation at the site, shall be maintained on the premises; . . 

I j 

. . 7. Parking, paving a~d drainage shall be proyided pursuant to specificitions 
ouiltned tn the Rivethead To'Mt Code; 

8~ That the parking area shall be tna.i1ltained pursuant W· specifications outliued in 
dte Ri·verbead Town Code; · . 

9. That adequate parking for tbe handicapped,. pursuant to. State and Fedoral law, 
s}lall 'be provided and that each handicap stall shall be designated by an individual sigp erected 
on a stanchion stating, ••No Pai'kin·g, Handicap Only", and the universal symbol affued 
thereto. , Further, by execution and filing of this document, Requerdo Company hereby 
authorizes and consents to the Town of Riverhead to enter premises at the southwest comer of 
O~d CQuntry Road (C.R. 58) and Roanoke Avenue tC.R. 73), Riverhead, New York, to enforee 
sa1d handj.~appe4 parking r.eguladons; 

· 10. That any and all landscaped ~nd paved areas sba~l be regularly tnaintained in 
an orderly and professional manner :and kept free of we¢s and litter; and that any planters, 
Plinter boxes, window boxt(s or other container plantings shall likewise ~ maintained on a y~ar-
rotrnd basis· . 

t ' ' ' . 

lZ .. Pursuant to Section 108~1331 of the Code of the ToWil ·of Riverbead, the 
appli~nt, upo~ approval of a final site plan by this resolu~on and prio! t~ th~ issuance of a 
buildtng pemu4 shall post a performance bond or other equtv.~ent secu.nty~ The. perfonn~n~e 
. bOnd or othet sectlrity .. ssures the performance of aU the· aoadtdonS of" the buHdt·wg pennst tn 
8Ctordance ~ith the site plan approval. The ~u~rvisor, upon ~pproval from the.J'~w~ ~ttorney 
as to form, ts hereby authorized tQ accept satd perfonnance bond or bdl~r secunty, ~hlch sha!l 
lt ftl¢<1 with the Town Clerk subsequent to approval of the s,it~plan herem. The building pemut 
Shall not be issued until ~ Town, Clerk certifies that the perf~nce bond or ot~~r secunry h~s 
~· nrea in the OffJCe of the Town Clerk of the Town of' Rivernead. Said secunty shan be Jn 
fUJJ force and effect fo~the term of ttre building permit or any renewal 'thereof~ 

·'' 
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· · · 13, That the topsoil shall conform to the specifications of the New York State 
Department of TranspOrtation in regard to ph, organi~ co~tent~ and .gradation; ·.. · 

14. That all nursery stock and installation methods tttereof sball meet the latest 
"American Standards for Nursery Stock," as published by the Americ~ Association of 
Nur:seryqten; and be it further · 

. RESOLVED, that the Town ·Glerk be and is hereby authorized to forward a 
catifi~d copy of this resolutiQn to Bruce Barnet, as agent for the R.equerdo Comany, the 
Riverh~a9. Planning ,Departrpent, Riverhead Building Department and the Town Engineer. 
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' ' 

DECLARATION AND COVEN.ANTS 

THIS DEC~ARATION, made the . day @f . . . 1995 made 
\y Requerdo Company, restding at 1770 Walt Whitman Road, Melville .NY 117 47, Declar:ant~ 

W-ITNESSETH: ·· -

. · WHEREAS, Declarant is the owner of certain . real property situate in tbe Town 
f ·of Riverhead, Suffolk Cou·nty, New York, more particularly bounded and described as set forth 

.. 1 in SCHEDULE ''A" annexed hereto, ·as provided by Declarant, and · · · 

1
.. · WHEREAS, for ~d in cof)Sideration of th~ gmnting of 'said site plan, the Town 

· B?mi of the Town of Riverhead has deemed it to be in the best interests of tl}e Town pf 
~ Riverh~ad, and the OWR.er and prospective owners of said parcel, that the within covenants and 

" ·l· 1 restt;icnons be impo~ed on said parcel~ and as a condition of granting said ·Site plan and said 
t Town Board has required that the within De<;laration be recorded in the Suffolk C{}unty ClerW s 
~ Office; and · · 

,, . ~ 

. . WHEREAS, Declarant has considered the foregoing arid determined that same 
Will be in the best interest of the Declarant and subsequent owners of said paroel, · 

NOW, THEREFORE, TH'IS DECLARANT WITNESSETH: 

. Tbat Decl~nt~ for tbe purpose of carrying out the intentions above- ·e'lpressed, 
does hereBy maie known1 admit, publish, covenant and agtee tl)at the said premises herein 

~ t ~esoribed shalt hereafter be subject to the following covenants which shalt run with the land, and 
shall be binding upon aU purchasers and holders of said premises, their heirs, executors, ·1ega1 
reprtsentatives, distributees, successors and ass.ig,ns; .to wit: 

. · 1. lltat the ,provisions of the Riverhead Town Code, which are not addressed by 
·. i :his resolution, or other official action 'Of the Town shall, at all times, be complied with oy the 

' owner of the propertY covered by thi.s site plan; ,. ~ ·· 

· 2. That the form, design~ location and color of aU signage shall . be submitted to 
the Towrt Board for its review and approval pursuant to the site plan process and the sign pennit 
t.rQc~ure ,prior _to bejng installed at the property; that ail signage sa proposed shall be 
ro.<>minated in ap~arance and design; and, that all provisions of Section .1 0~-5(j: of t~e 
Rtverhead· Town Code shall be complied with, and that all tenants shall ~ ~pnsed o( satd 
rtquiremcnts -and m1y restrictions imposed as a cottdftion of the site plan approval granted herein; 

' · . 3. No lighting shall be installed or adjusted in such a way as to cause direct glare 
·tn rreigllboring ptoperties or adjoining highways; . . 

• . . _ 4~ That ·the applicant i~ famifiar with the Riverhead. ~~wtt Codel _€hapt~· 96, 
~lltled~ .. Trash, Rubbis,h and.Re.fuse Dts,posal'', apd,Chapter 93~ prohibtttng tbe -.accumu.Jat-ron of 
htter, and requiring the enclosure of dumpsterst and .a~es to abtde by same; 

. 5. ntat receptacl&s of a dec<:>nttive desi.gn, a·pptove~ by· lbe Planning Depattnient 
Ptlor to their installation at the site,. hall be tnaintained on tbe .prenuses;. · . · ' 

' . . ) ' 

· · · · · 6. Parking, paving· and drainage shall be provided pursuant to speciflcations 

1 
OUtlined io the Riverhead T'Own Code·; · · · ·~ 
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. 7 .. That the parking area shall be maintained pursuant to specifications outlined in 
the Riverhead Town Code; · · . · . 

S. Th~t adequate paPldng for the handicapped, pmsuant to State and Federal law., 
Shall be provided .and that each handicap stall shalf be designated by an .individual sign erected 
on a stanchion stating, ••.No Parking, HanUicap Onlyn, and the universal symbol affixed 
there~; 

, , , 9~ That .any ~d all landscaped and paved areas shall oo regularly maintained in 
.an orderly and profession~al manner and kept free of weeds and litter; and that any p~anters, 
plant~ boxes; window bo~e$ or other container plantings shall likewise be maintained on a year-
roqnd b~si~; . . , · · · 

10. Pursuant to Section 108-. 1331 of the Code of the Town of Riverhead, the 
applicant, UP,on approval of a fwal s.ite plan by this resolution and prior I to the issuance of a 
building perrpit, shall post a performance bond or other equivalent security. The peffonnance 
bOnd or other. security assures the perfonnance of all the conditions of the building permit in 
·accordance with the site Rlan approval. The Supervisor.1 upon approval frOm the Town Attorney 
.s ~o form, is hereby authorized to accept said performance bond or other S"'ecurity, which shall 

· , te filed wiUt the Town Clerk sqbsequent to approval of the site plan herein. The building permit 
shalt not be issued until the Town Clerk cenifies that the pt'rformance bond or other security bas 
reen filed in the Offic~ o.f the Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead. Said security shall be in· 
full foree and effect for the t~IW of the building permit or any renewal .thetOOf; 

· · · 11. ·That the topsoil shall confo(Dl to the specifications of the New York State 
Department of Transportation in regard to ph, organic content, and ,gradation; 

. 1 

12. That all nursery stock and installation methods the{e(lf shall tneet the l!ltes·t 
Standards for Nursery Stock,n ·as published l>y the . American Association .of 

Declarant has hereunto set his (her) hand rujd seal the day an4 yecu;- above fust 

l THE REQUERDO CO'MPANY 

BY: 
,, 

SiATE OF NEW 7i0RK) ~ 
. )SS~ : 

NTY OF S.UFFOLK) 

day of . ~ . 1995, before me per~nany. came 
~ • • -,"'"-. - •. ~.--.;. I ' • to ;JT~e known, and kn'OWn to .. me t~ be orte of t~.e mertfuets 
~ the fum of . . desen bed m and who executed the 
1\>tegoing instnuuent, and (s)he t\Ckflowledged tO me that (s)he executed tne same Q.S and for the 
tt and deed Qf sald firm. 

NOTARY PUBLIC 

., ' 
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. ! STATB OF NBW YORK) 
, ) . ~SS~~ 
. ~ COUN1Y OF SlJFFOLK) 

On the day -of _ , 1995, before me personally came 
, _ _ , who, being sworn by me, did depos.e and say: that (s)he 

'" is tbe . : .. _ of · · . . ; that (s)he 
. mows the s~al of the cor.poration; that the seal affixed to lliis instniment i$ said seal; and that it 

was affixed by. order of the BoaFd of Directors of the Corporation. 

I ' 

·NOTARY PUBLIC 

) ' 

Th&Vote 
. Yes£ No._ -...i':'i 

Yes~ No . c:. 

Ye$~ No.~ ~­
.Yes~ No ....... · ~ 

.Ttle aesotutiQn is therefore 
deota~d <futy adoPted . 

'· 
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DECEMBJR 5, 1995 

·' 
,. 

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

Resolution # _ 7 ~a . 

AUTRORIZBSATTENDANCEOF 

BIJJLDING DEPARTMENT EMPLOYEE AT SEMINAR 

1531 

!IU.:1!6.11t..I..D.a!J!D!.."!~~~!.!...:_....,......:.;;_ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUnON 

.. COUNCIL~ CHa~1 
. ' 

WHEREAS, fhe New Y or!< State Code Enforcement Training Schedule will be offered 
througli the first quarter of 1996~ and . 

·WHEREAS, th-e Building Departinent Head has requested Town Board autborization fot the 
. attendance of Scott Sinnickson at said-seminars in ordet to receive certification,, and 

WHEREAS, Cours.e #4 2 will be ·held in Rockbtnd County, Match 12, 1996 through March 
14, 1996, therefore, requiring accommodati-On& for three days~ 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that Scott Sinnicksen is authorized to attend 
said serninar·and mafce arrangements for accommodations~ 

. " 

BE-IT·FURTHER RESOLVED~ that Scott Sinnickson wilt fully .. account fQ{ expenditures, 
with receipts,. upon his return. 

. ,. 

.JE. IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be. and is hereby auttiorized to 
~ard a certified copy of tbis resolution to tbe Building Department Scott Situdckson and tbe 
~fti~ of Accounting. ' 

ounam 
~ 
Stalk 
p.~ 

· ~Resofotlon .Is tnetefbre· 
dectared duty· adopted 
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wa~ seconded b)• 
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·1215/95 

TOWN OP RIVERHEAD 

A;~CEeTS lJQNDS QF BLUFFS U.<ARLENSMAINTENANCE CORfORATlON) 

ceU!'IC1LMJ.'N s-:r ARK ~ offered the follO\~lflg reso14tiOn, was seconded by 

COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI : 

WHEREAS, by resoltttion adopted on Augu5t 3~ 1995, the ruverhead Planning Board 
approved the revised condorninium map entitled, ucondominiutn Map, The Knolls ofF ox Hill, at 
Baiting Hollow, Town ofR.iverhead1 County of Suffolk, New York", dated September 7, 1995 

{ ~nd revised Septetnber 18
1 
1995~ and ,. · 

WltEREAS. it is necessary that the owner(s) of this condominium post financial security 
in the stun of $2,000 pc;r unit in accordance with Local· Law #I· of 1 '987 and $I ,500. 00 per unit 
cov~ring payment ofWat~ District Key Money. 

' 

NOW THEREFOJtE BE IT RESOLVED, that Town Board hereby accepts An1erican 
Automobile Ipsurance Company Performance Bond N.o, 11 3 320 J 46A in the sum of Sixty Six 
Thousand ($66,000.00) Dotlars covering the payment ofWa.fer District Key Money and American 
Automobite Insurance Company Performance Bond No. 11 3 3 20 l4 56 in the sum of Eighty Eight 
l~1ousand ($88,000.QO) D6Jtars covering the payment of fees Clue in accordance with Local Law 
fll ·uf 1981, subJect to the conditions· set forth herein; and be it further · 

" 

.ad(t· -~~ , that American Automobile ·Insurance Company Performance Bond Nt:> J 'l 
332Q}jl64 in th~s~, ofSi~~$i~ Thousand ($66,000;00) Doftars eovering the payntetlt of Water 
'l:ltsti'i~ K~ Mon'ey and ~~rlcah Automol:>ile lnsur!Jnoe ~mpany Perfu~anCe Bond No. 11 
JJJtS~56 .&A· thewm of !\l\ty Bight Thousand ($.88,.000.00) Dollars covenog the payment of 
!~dtte itt!c~rdanee with Lo~l LJw IJJ of 1987 are h~reby acc~pted upon the foUowing 
t<m4J~ons·· that such fees shall be- owed and payable upon the earlier of either. the application for a 

'ti'Fttficateofoccupancy or on September 30\ 1997, when such fees in the total amounts of Sixty 
S~ :ntolffind (J66~000.00) Oo'llars and tighty Eight Thousand ($88,000.00) Dollars shall 
~come ·due ahd payable immedil lely upon rec-eipt of such nodce by the Town· and be it further 

RESOLVED, tha't the Town Clerk be and is hereby directed to fOrward a tertifled copy 
oftbis resofutiof\ to Atlett M. Stnitl"t\ Esq .. 737 Roanoke Avenue, P.O~ Box 1240, Riverhead. New 
rork ~ l 1,90 I ~ Pierre G. Lundber~ E$q.". 456 Ortffing Avenue, P.O. Box J.89~ Rjverheatf~ New 
. York~ t 190 I ~ American A\ttOBlobHe ,.Insurance C·fimpany .. One Liberty Plaza; 20th F·foor~ N'w 
~ork, Nevv York~ 10006; Gary Pendzick;. the Planning Department~ tbe Building Department~ tile 
Jtigtnvay Departn-lent Kenne.tb Test~ P .E. and the Accounting Department 

'' ' 


