
Town of Riverhead 
4 West Second Street 
Riverhead, NY  11901 

 
 
 
 

TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern, 
Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; Vanessa LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew 
Dillingham, Town Engineer; Ken Testa, Deputy Town Engineer 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s 

Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent 
 
DATE:  May 17, 2024 
 
RE: Bid Opening Report for Street Light and Traffic Signal Maintenance Repair 

Parts 
 
 
2 bids were received and opened on May 16, 2024 at 11am: 
 
Traffic Systems Inc. 
1 Corporate Dr, Suite 1 
Holtsville, NY 11742 
wteese@trafficsystemsinc.com 
 
Schwing Electric Supply Corp 
1328 E Main St 
Riverhead, NY 11901 
mattg@schwingelectric.com 
 
 
Results of the bid opening are attached. Bids have been forwarded to the Engineering 
for review.  
 

Timothy Hubbard 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Agent 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
B1 $6.95 No bid
B2 $6.39 No bid
B3 $19.85 No bid
B4 $18.45 No bid
B5 $49.50 Silvan LCD36HIDR8SC2MCD No bid

TB1 No bid No bid
TB2 No bid No bid

MC1 $12.00 Tork 5237-UL No bid
MC2 No bid No bid
MC3 No bid Discontinued No bid
MC4 No bid No bid
MC5 $15.50 Tork 2421 No bid
MC6 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC7 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC8 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC9 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid

MC10 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid

BC1 No bid No bid
BC2 No bid No bid
BC3 No bid No bid
BC4 No bid No bid

5/16/2024

 Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
William Teese
631-242-4292

John Dunigan
631-727-1155

Page 1 of 5



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

5/16/2024

 Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
William Teese
631-242-4292

John Dunigan
631-727-1155

BC5 No bid No bid
BC6 No bid No bid

FP1 No bid Discontinued No bid
FP2 $255.00 No bid
FP3 $199.50 No bid
FP4 $1,387.00 No bid
FP5 $1,194.00 No bid
FP6 $477.55 No bid
FP7 $649.00 FFbs/ssf7pl No bid  
FP8 $649.00 FFbs/ssf7pl No bid  
FP9 No bid Discontinued No bid

FP10 $59.95 No bid
FP11 $49.95 No bid
FP12 $74.95 No bid
FP13 $92.95 No bid
FP14 $215.95 No bid
FP15 $683.00 BS20 No bid
FP16 No bid No bid
FP17 $523.00 No bid
FP18 $825.00 No bid
FP19 $1,750.00 No bid
FP20 $575.00 No bid
FP21 $517.00 No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

5/16/2024

 Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
William Teese
631-242-4292

John Dunigan
631-727-1155

FP22 $675.00 No bid
FP23 $255.00 No bid
FP24 $2,240.00 No bid

BF1 No bid No bid
FH1 $21.95 No bid
FH2 $5.60 ATM 15 No bid
FH3 $5.95 ATM 20 No bid
FH4 $5.95 ATM 30 No bid

LL1 No bid $55.00
LL2 No bid $55.00
LL3 No bid $55.00
LL4 No bid $52.25
LL5 No bid $52.25
LL6 No bid $52.25
LL8 No bid $138.25
LL9 No bid $239.25

LTS1 No bid $1,932.50
LTS2 No bid $510.00
LTS3 No bid $646.00
LTS4 No bid $173.75
LTS5 No bid $5,452.00
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

5/16/2024

 Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
William Teese
631-242-4292

John Dunigan
631-727-1155

LTS6 No bid $34.25
LTS7 No bid $35.50
LTS8 No bid $1,101.50
LTS9 No bid $149.75

LTS10 No bid $67.00
LTS11 No bid $719.50
LTS12 No bid $3,515.00
LTS13 No bid $3,836.00
LTS14 No bid $235.00
LTS15 No bid $38.00
LTS16 No bid $235.00
LTS17 No bid $102.50
LTS18 No bid $91.75
LTS19 No bid $40.75
LTS20 No bid $19.25

ME1 $68.50 No bid
ME2 $4.95 No bid
ME3 $8.95 No bid
ME4 No bid No bid
ME5 No bid No bid
ME6 No bid No bid
ME7 $45.00 PER JUG No bid
ME8 $66.00 PER JUG No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

5/16/2024

 Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
William Teese
631-242-4292

John Dunigan
631-727-1155

ME9 $47.00 PER JUG No bid
ME10 No bid No bid
ME11 No bid No bid
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