
Town of Riverhead 
4 West Second Street 
Riverhead, NY  11901 

 
 
 
 

TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern, 
Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; Vanessa LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew 
Dillingham, Town Engineer; Annemarie Prudenti, Deputy Town Attorney 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s 

Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent 
 
DATE:  July 18, 2024 
 
RE: Bid Opening Report for Re-Bid Residential Solid Waste Collection and 

Disposal  
 
 
 
5 bids were received and opened on July 18, 2024 at 11am: 
 
National Waste Services LLC 
1 Jem Court 
Bayshore, NY 11706 
virginia@nws-ny.com 
 
Colucci Carting LLC 
50 Miller Place-Yaphank Rd 
Middle Island, NY 11953 
jcolucci@coluccicarting.com 
 

European American Waste Disposal 
1679 Hannington Ave 
Wantagh, NY 11793 
eawd26@hotmail.com 
 
Maggio Environmental LLC 
88 Old Dock Rd 
Yaphank. NY 11980 
slomangino@mesliny.com 

 
Maggio Environmental LLC submitted 2 bids – one offering rear-loading trucks and one 
offering automatic side-loader trucks. 
 
Results of the bid opening are attached. All bids will be forwarded to the Town Engineer 
for review. 

Timothy Hubbard 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Agent 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

BID BOND:

BID #

BID NAME:

BID OPENING DATE:  

TRUCK TYPE

Total 5 Year Bid

$3,969,066.60

$4,426,819.20

$3,095,174.40

$3,275,126.40

$5,448,046.80

Yes

Joseph Leone

$4,772,371.50

Total 5 Year Bid

$3,668,395.50

$4,091,472.00

$2,860,704.00

$3,027,024.00

$5,035,338.00

$3,583,156.50

Colucci Carting LLC
Joseph Colucci
631-509-0427

European American WasteNational Waste

$5,291,952.00

Frank Ozpolat
631-484-2270

Yes Yes
ITEM #

CBA A - Option 1

CBA B - Option 1

CBA C- Option 1

CBA D - Option 1

631-242-0300

$4,187,168.00

$4,570,384.00

Total 5 Year Bid

$4,963,538.50

CBA E - Option 1

CBA A - Option 2 $4,963,538.50 $3,668,395.50 $4,552,410.00

Total Option 1

CBA F - Option 1

$5,955,698.00

$3,876,841.20

$29,741,112.00

CBA B - Option 2 $5,291,952.00 $4,091,472.00 $5,077,440.00

CBA C- Option 2 $4,187,168.00 $2,860,704.00 $3,550,080.00

$3,027,024.00 $3,756,480.00

CBA E - Option 2 $5,955,698.00 $5,035,338.00 $6,248,760.00

$22,266,090.00 $24,091,074.60

Maggio Environmental

CBA F - Option 2 $4,772,371.50 $3,583,156.50 $4,446,630.00

CBA D - Option 2 $4,570,384.00

Total 5 Year Bid

Maggio Environmental
Stanley Lomangino Stanley Lomangino

631-696-6300 631-696-6300

Yes Yes

$4,069,228.80

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Total 5 Year Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

$6,128,144.40 $6,769,005.60

$4,360,799.70 $4,816,837.08

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$3,845,644.80

$3,683,971.20

2024-21

Re-Bid Residential Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

July 18 2024

$4,979,433.60 $5,500,166.40

$3,481,555.20

No Bid

$4,464,537.90 $4,931,424.60

No Bid

Total Option 2 $29,741,112.00 $22,266,090.00 $27,631,800.00 $27,098,442.00 $29,932,307.28

Rear Loading Rear Loading Not Defined Rear Loading Side Loading
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