



Yvette Aguiar
Supervisor

Town of Riverhead
200 Howell Avenue
Riverhead, NY 11901

Teresa Balducci
Purchasing Agent
631-727-3200 Ext. 271

TO: Supervisor Aguiar; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Beyrodt, Hubbard, Kern, Rothwell; Julie O'Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Mike Zaleski, Superintendent of Highways

CC: Carol Delvecchio, Clerk's Office; Joan Motern, Highways

FROM: Teresa Balducci, Purchasing Agent

DATE: August 18, 2022

RE: Bid Opening Report for Grinding Yard Waste for Highway Department

4 bids were received and opened on August 18, 2022 at 11am:

B&B Maintenance Services Inc.
25 Grucci La
Brookhaven, NY 11719
bobby@bbmaintenanceservices.com

Crown Sanitation Inc.
865 Yaphank Ave
Calverton, NY 11933
frossano@crowncyclingfacility.net

Hampton Landscape Supply, Inc,
11 Barnes Rd
Moriches, NY 11955
HamptonLandscapeSupply@gmail.com

Southampton Excavation & Site Development
110 N Magee St
Southampton, NY 11968
cole@shexcavation.com

Results of the bid opening are attached. All bids have been forwarded to the Highway Superintendent for review.

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
 BID TAB SHEET

| | | | | | |
|--|---|--------------------|-------------------------------|---|-------------|
| BID # | 2022-27 | | | | |
| BID NAME: | Grinding of Yard Waste for Highway Department | | | | |
| BID OPENING DATE: | 8/18/2022 | | | | |
| COMPANY: | B&B Maintenance Services Inc. | Crown Sanitation | Hampton Landscape Supply Inc. | Southampton Excavation & Site Development | |
| CONTACT: | Robert Waldhof Jr. | Frank Rossano | Matthew Cartalemi | Cole Mmezynieski | |
| PHONE #: | 631-803-2227 | 631-727-3939 | 914-462-8711 | 631-204-0001 | |
| ITEM | BID AMOUNTS | BID AMOUNTS | BID AMOUNTS | BID AMOUNTS | |
| OPTION A | | | With Town Fuel | | |
| a) Cost per day, single grind | \$5,999.00 | no bid | \$7,500.00 | \$6,500.00 | \$12,000.00 |
| b) Cost per 3 day, single grind | \$17,999.00 | no bid | \$22,500.00 | \$19,500.00 | \$36,000.00 |
| Contractor availability | ASAP | | ASAP | ASAP | 8/29/2022 |
| OPTION B | | | | | |
| a) Cost per day, double grind | \$5,999.00 | no bid | \$8,000.00 | \$6,500.00 | \$12,000.00 |
| b) Cost per 3 day, double grind | \$17,999.00 | no bid | \$24,000.00 | \$19,500.00 | \$36,000.00 |
| Contractor availability | ASAP | | ASAP | ASAP | 8/29/2022 |
| OPTION C | | | | | |
| Cost to grind all material, single grind | \$22,000.00 | no bid | \$74,999.00 | \$70,500.00 | no bid |
| Contractor availability | ASAP | | ASAP | ASAP | |
| OPTION D | | | | | |
| Cost to grind all material, double grind | \$34,000.00 | \$28,450.00 | \$60,000.00 | \$50,000.00 | no bid |
| Contractor availability | ASAP | ASAP | ASAP | ASAP | |