



Office of the Town Clerk
Diane M. Wilhelm

Registrar of Vital Statistics

Records Management Officer

Marriage Officer

TO: Supervisor Walter; Councilpersons Dunleavy; Wooten; Gabrielsen; Giglio; Robert Kozakiewicz, Town Attorney; Maryann Tague, Purchasing; Mark Conklin, Water District

FROM: Diane Wilhelm Town Clerk

DATE: March 17, 2015

RE: Bid for Water Service Materials

3 bids were received and opened at 11:05 on March 17, 2015

Company Name

T. Mina Supply Inc.
168 Long Island Avenue
Holtsville, NY 11742
(631)475-7400
Tom.cox@tmina.com
Roberto.cano@tmina.com

See attached bid sheets

Blackman Plumbing Supply
2700 Route 112
Medford, NY 11763
(631) 475-3170
ijerman@blackman.com

See attached bid sheets

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd
650 Sheafe Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601
(845) 462-0010
Brian.robinson@hdsupply.com

See attached bid sheets

**BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR REBID
OF WATER SERVICE MATERIALS
BID #2015-36A-RWD**

(NOTE: ANY ITEM LISTING "OR EQUAL" MUST BE IDENTIFIED BY MAKE AND MODEL NUMBER ON A SEPARATE SHEET AND INCLUDE A COPY OF THE MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION SHEET)

****ALL BRASS ITEMS BID MUST BE "NO-LEAD" PURSUANT TO THE REDUCTION OF LEAD IN DRINKING WATER ACT (SENATE BILL 3874 SIGNED JANUARY, 2011)****

PLEASE READ CAREFULLY

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	PRICE
22.	FORD A4-T DUCTILE IRON METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL.	<u>117.25</u>
23.	FORD MC-36-T LARGE METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL	<u>577.80</u>
24.	FORD FIB 48" X 48" X 3/32" THICK METER PIT INSULATING BLANKET	<u>14.60</u>
32.	FORD EC-1 5/8" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>16.59</u>
33.	FORD EC-23 3/4" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>18.80</u>
34.	FORD EC-4 1" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>31.58</u>
59.	FORD VBHH76-24-11-66-G 1 1/2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL <i>VBHH76-24-44-66-G-NL</i> <i>WITH GRIP JOINT LESS BYPASS</i>	<u>1018.13</u>
60.	FORD VBHH77-24-11-77-G 2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL <i>VBHH77-24-44-77-G-NL</i> <i>WITH GRIP JOINT LESS BYPASS</i>	<u>1135.09</u>
61.	FORD VBHH76-24HB-11-66-G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL <i>VBHH77-24HB-44-66-G-NL</i> <i>WITH GRIP JOINT AND HIGH BYPASS</i>	<u>1378.83</u>
62.	FORD VBHH77-24HB-11-77G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL <i>VBHH77-24HB-44-77-G-NL</i> <i>WITH GRIP JOINT AND HIGH BYPASS</i>	<u>1531.94</u>
125.	6" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>38.91</u>
126.	8" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>53.71</u>
127.	10" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>77.55</u>
128.	12" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>105.13</u>
129.	6" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>314.19</u>

BIDDER NAME: T. Mina Supply, Inc.

130.	8" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>400.04</u>
131.	10" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>531.56</u>
132.	12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>1087.12</u>
133.	6" X 6" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>221.03</u>
134.	8" X 8" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>275.83</u>
135.	10" X 10" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>433.83</u>
136.	12" X 12" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>479.51</u>
137.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 90° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>119.60</u>
138.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 45° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>98.80</u>
139.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 22° BEND (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>90.13</u>
140.	6" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH <u>18'</u> X \$ <u>23.46</u> =	<u>422.28</u>
141.	8" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH <u>20'</u> X \$ <u>32.08</u> =	<u>641.60</u>
142.	10" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH <u>20'</u> X \$ <u>43.91</u> =	<u>878.20</u>
143.	12" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH <u>20'</u> X \$ <u>52.81</u> =	<u>1056.20</u>
160.	KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO FIRE HYDRANT WITH 6" MJ FOOT & 5' BURY	<u>2507.58</u>
161.	KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO HYDRANT REPAIR KIT	<u>169.10</u>
162.	KENNEDY 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT	<u>170.50</u>
163.	KENNEDY 1' HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT.	<u>334.88</u>
204.	DOMESTIC 1" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>11.74</u>

BIDDER NAME: T. Mina Supply, Inc.

205.	DOMESTIC 2" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>18.59</u>
206.	DOMESTIC 3" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>31.31</u>
207.	DOMESTIC 4" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>45.01</u>
208.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COMPLETE WITH COVERS & 16" TOP SECTION (ALL CAST IRON)	<u>186.32</u>
209.	16" DUCTILE IRON VALVE BOX TOP FLANGE TOP SECTION WITH COVER, DOMESTIC	<u>84.16</u>
210.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COVERS	<u>17.61</u>
211.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX BOTTOM SECTION (CAST IRON)	<u>105.38</u>
212.	DOMESTIC 16" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION.	<u>90.63</u>
213.	DOMESTIC 26" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION.	<u>102.22</u>
214.	BUFFALO-TYPE 2 1/2" CAST IRON CURB BOX.	<u>94.85</u>
227.	FORD 3/4" C44-33-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT	<u>28.25</u>
228.	FORD 1" C44-44-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT	<u>32.31</u>
229.	FORD 3/4" FSC-088-6 ^{6R2} 6R2 PIPE OD .875 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>49.48</u>
230.	FORD 3/4" FSC-105-6R2 PIPE OD 1.05 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>49.48</u>
231.	FORD 1" FSC-113-6R2 PIPE OD 1.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>49.83</u>
232.	FORD 1" FSC-132-6R2 PIPE OD 1.32 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>49.83</u>
233.	FORD 1 1/4" FSC-138-6R2 PIPE OD 1.375 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>50.76</u>
234.	FORD 1 1/4" FSC-166-6R2 PIPE OD 1.66 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>50.76</u>
235.	FORD 1 1/2" FSC-163-6R2 PIPE OD 1.625 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>51.37</u>
236.	FORD 1 1/2" FSC-190-6R2 PIPE OD 1.90 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>51.37</u>

BIDDER NAME: T. Mina Supply, Inc.

237.	FORD 2" FSC-213-6R2 PIPE OD 2.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>52.73</u>
238.	FORD 2" FSC-238-6R2 PIPE OD 2.38 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>52.73</u>
239.	FORD 6" FLSI-(6.35,6.96,7.24,7.75,7.85) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>155.47</u>
240.	FORD 8" FLSI-(8.35,8.94,9.39,9.67) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>188.95</u>
241.	FORD 10" FLSI-(10.10,11.04,11.44,11.74,12.15) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>256.56</u>
242.	FORD 12" FLSI-(12.40,13.02,13.50,13.80,14.10,14.40) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>291.91</u>
243.	FORD PTB-BR PLASTIC AMR PLUG	<u>7.44</u>
244.	FORD PTB-BR-3-25 PLASTIC AMR PLUG	<u>11.03</u>
245.	W3BPO PLASTIC INNER LID	<u>5.46</u>
246.	W3PD PLASTIC INNER LID	<u>161.15</u>

BIDDER NAME: T. Mina Supply, Inc.

**BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR REBID
OF WATER SERVICE MATERIALS
BID #2015-36A-RWD**

(NOTE: ANY ITEM LISTING "OR EQUAL" MUST BE IDENTIFIED BY MAKE AND MODEL NUMBER ON A SEPARATE SHEET AND INCLUDE A COPY OF THE MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION SHEET)

****ALL BRASS ITEMS BID MUST BE "NO-LEAD" PURSUANT TO THE REDUCTION OF LEAD IN DRINKING WATER ACT (SENATE BILL 3874 SIGNED JANUARY, 2011)****

PLEASE READ CAREFULLY

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	PRICE
22.	FORD A4-T DUCTILE IRON METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL.	\$ 52 ⁰⁰
23.	FORD MC-36-T LARGE METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL	\$ 415 ⁰⁰
24.	FORD FIB 48" X 48" X 3/32" THICK METER PIT INSULATING BLANKET	NO BID
32.	FORD EC-1 5/8" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	\$ 16 ⁰⁰
	H 14234 N MUELLER AS EQUAL	
33.	FORD EC-23 3/4" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	\$ 19 ⁰⁰
	H 14234 N MUELLER AS EQUAL	
34.	FORD EC-4 1" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	\$ 31 ⁰⁰
	H 14234 N MUELLER AS EQUAL	
59.	FORD VBHH76-24-11-66-G 1 1/2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	\$ 890 ⁰⁰
	B-2422 - 2N MUELLER Co	
60.	FORD VBHH77-24-11-77-G 2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	\$ 1187 ⁰⁰
	B-2422 - 2N MUELLER Co	
61.	FORD VBHH76-24HB-11-66-G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	\$ 1173 ⁰⁰
	B-2423 - 99000 N MUELLER Co	
62.	FORD VBHH77-24HB-11-77G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	\$ 1480 ⁰⁰
	B-2423 - 99000 N MUELLER Co	
125.	6" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	\$ 42 ⁰⁰
126.	8" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	\$ 42 ⁵⁰
127.	10" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	\$ 90 ⁰⁰
128.	12" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	\$ 92 ⁰⁰
129.	6" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	\$ 95 ⁰⁰
	C-153 LOR Co	

BLACKMAN PLUMBING SUPPLY CO., INC.
2700 ROUTE 112
MEDFORD, NY 11763

BIDDER NAME: _____

- | | | |
|------|---|--------------------|
| 130. | 8" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 LONG | 124 ⁰⁰ |
| 131. | 10" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 LONG | 186 ⁰⁰ |
| 132. | 12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 LONG | 252 ⁰⁰ |
| 133. | 6" X 6" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 | 181 ⁰⁰ |
| 134. | 8" X 8" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 | 226 ⁰⁰ |
| 135. | 10" X 10" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 | 355 ⁰⁰ |
| 136. | 12" X 12" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)
CIS3 | 413 ⁰⁰ |
| 137. | 6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 90° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING) | 108 ⁰⁰ |
| 138. | 6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 45° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING) | 89 ⁰⁰ |
| 139. | 6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 22° BEND (DOMESTIC CASTING) | 81 ⁰⁰ |
| 140. | 6" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH
20 X \$ 28 ⁰⁰ = | 560 ⁰⁰ |
| 141. | 8" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH
20 X \$ 38 ⁰⁰ = | 760 ⁰⁰ |
| 142. | 10" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH
20 X \$ 52 ⁰⁰ = | 1040 ⁰⁰ |
| 143. | 12" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH
20 X \$ 63 ⁰⁰ = | 1260 ⁰⁰ |
| 160. | KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO FIRE HYDRANT WITH 6" MJ FOOT & 5' BURY | No Bid |
| 161. | KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO HYDRANT REPAIR KIT | No Bid |
| 162. | KENNEDY 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT | No Bid |
| 163. | KENNEDY 1' HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT. | No Bid |
| 204. | DOMESTIC 1" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER. | No Bid |

BLACKMAN PLUMBING SUPPLY CO., INC.

2700 ROUTE 112

MEDFORD, NY 11763

BIDDER NAME: _____

- 205. DOMESTIC 2" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER. No Bid
- 206. DOMESTIC 3" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER. No Bid
- 207. DOMESTIC 4" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER. No Bid
- 208. DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COMPLETE WITH COVERS & 16" TOP SECTION (ALL CAST IRON) No Bid
- 209. 16" DUCTILE IRON VALVE BOX TOP FLANGE TOP SECTION WITH COVER, DOMESTIC No Bid
- 210. DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COVERS No Bid
- 211. DOMESTIC VALVE BOX BOTTOM SECTION (CAST IRON) No Bid
- 212. DOMESTIC 16" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION. No Bid
- 213. DOMESTIC 26" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION. No Bid
- 214. BUFFALO-TYPE 2 1/2" CAST IRON CURB BOX. No Bid
- 227. FORD 3/4" C44-33-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT No Bid
- 228. FORD 1" C44-44-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT No Bid
- 229. FORD 3/4" FSC-088-642 PIPE OD .875 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 230. FORD 3/4" FSC-105-6R2 PIPE OD 1.05 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 231. FORD 1" FSC-113-6R2 PIPE OD 1.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 232. FORD 1" FSC-132-6R2 PIPE OD 1.32 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 233. FORD 1 1/4" FSC-138-6R2 PIPE OD 1.375 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 234. FORD 1 1/4" FSC-166-6R2 PIPE OD 1.66 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 235. FORD 1 1/2" FSC-163-6R2 PIPE OD 1.625 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid
- 236. FORD 1 1/2" FSC-190-6R2 PIPE OD 1.90 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP No Bid

BLACKMAN PLUMBING SUPPLY CO., INC.
2700 ROUTE 112
MEDFORD, NY 11763

BIDDER NAME: _____

- | | | |
|------|---|---------------|
| 237. | FORD 2" FSC-213-6R2 PIPE OD 2.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 238. | FORD 2" FSC-238-6R2 PIPE OD 2.38 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 239. | FORD 6" FLSI-(6.35,6.96,7.24,7.75,7.85) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 240. | FORD 8" FLSI-(8.35,8.94,9.39,9.67) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 241. | FORD 10" FLSI-(10.10,11.04,11.44,11.74,12.15) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 242. | FORD 12" FLSI-(12.40,13.02,13.50,13.80,14.10,14.40) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 243. | FORD PTB-BR PLASTIC AMR PLUG | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 244. | FORD PTB-BR-3-25 PLASTIC AMR PLUG | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 245. | W3BPO PLASTIC INNER LID | <u>No Bid</u> |
| 246. | W3PD PLASTIC INNER LID | <u>No Bid</u> |

BLACKMAN PLUMBING SUPPLY CO., INC.
 2700 ROUTE 112
 MEDFORD, NY 11763

BIDDER NAME: _____

**BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR REBID
OF WATER SERVICE MATERIALS
BID #2015-36A-RWD**

(NOTE: ANY ITEM LISTING "OR EQUAL" MUST BE IDENTIFIED BY MAKE AND MODEL NUMBER ON A SEPARATE SHEET AND INCLUDE A COPY OF THE MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION SHEET)

****ALL BRASS ITEMS BID MUST BE "NO-LEAD" PURSUANT TO THE REDUCTION OF LEAD IN DRINKING WATER ACT (SENATE BILL 3874 SIGNED JANUARY, 2011)****

PLEASE READ CAREFULLY

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	PRICE
22.	FORD A4-T DUCTILE IRON METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL.	<u>114.81</u>
23.	FORD MC-36-T LARGE METER PIT COVER, OR EQUAL	<u>587.59</u>
24.	FORD FIB 48" X 48" X 3/32" THICK METER PIT INSULATING BLANKET	<u>14.30</u>
32.	FORD EC-1 5/8" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>16.24</u>
33.	FORD EC-23 3/4" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>18.41</u>
34.	FORD EC-4 1" STANDARD EXPANSION CONNECTION, OR EQUAL.	<u>30.92</u>
59.	FORD VBHH76-24-11-66-G 1 1/2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	<u>936.25</u>
60.	FORD VBHH77-24-11-77-G 2" IRRIGATION COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	<u>1,018.70</u>
61.	FORD VBHH76-24HB-11-66-G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	<u>1,307.03</u>
62.	FORD VBHH77-24HB-11-77G DOMESTIC COPPERSETTER, OR EQUAL	<u>1,407.29</u>
125.	6" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>33.24</u>
126.	8" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>45.11</u>
127.	10" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>64.46</u>
128.	12" MJ RETAINER KIT FOR DI (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>86.41</u>
129.	6" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>83.39</u>

BIDDER NAME: HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

130.	8" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>108.85</u>
131.	10" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>163.33</u>
132.	12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>220.53</u>
133.	6" X 6" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>158.50</u>
134.	8" X 8" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>198.47</u>
135.	10" X 10" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>311.49</u>
136.	12" X 12" X 6" HYDRANT TEE, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>361.80</u>
137.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 90° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>95.10</u>
138.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 45° BEND, LESS ACCESSORIES (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>78.56</u>
139.	6" MECHANICAL JOINT WITH 22° BEND (DOMESTIC CASTING)	<u>71.67</u>
140.	6" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH _____ X \$ _____ =	<u>No bid</u>
141.	8" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH _____ X \$ _____ =	<u>No bid</u>
142.	10" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH _____ X \$ _____ =	<u>No bid</u>
143.	12" PUSH-ON DI PIPE CL52, (DOMESTIC CASTING) SPECIFY LENGTH _____ X \$ _____ =	<u>No bid</u>
160.	KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO FIRE HYDRANT WITH 6" MJ FOOT & 5' BURY	<u>2,369.56</u>
161.	KENNEDY 4 1/2" MVO HYDRANT REPAIR KIT	<u>145.01</u>
162.	KENNEDY 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT	<u>287.17</u>
163.	KENNEDY 1' HYDRANT EXTENSION KIT.	<u>337.27</u>
204.	DOMESTIC 1" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>No bid</u>

BIDDER NAME: HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

205.	DOMESTIC 2" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>No bid</u>
206.	DOMESTIC 3" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>No bid</u>
207.	DOMESTIC 4" CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER.	<u>No bid</u>
208.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COMPLETE WITH COVERS & 16" TOP SECTION (ALL CAST IRON)	<u>No bid</u>
209.	16" DUCTILE IRON VALVE BOX TOP FLANGE TOP SECTION WITH COVER, DOMESTIC	<u>No bid</u>
210.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX COVERS	<u>No bid</u>
211.	DOMESTIC VALVE BOX BOTTOM SECTION (CAST IRON)	<u>No bid</u>
212.	DOMESTIC 16" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION.	<u>No bid</u>
213.	DOMESTIC 26" CAST IRON LINE VALVE BOX TOP SECTION.	<u>No bid</u>
214.	BUFFALO-TYPE 2 1/2" CAST IRON CURB BOX.	<u>No bid</u>
227.	FORD 3/4" C44-33-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT	<u>25.00</u>
228.	FORD 1" C44-44-4-75-Q-NL EXTENDED LENGTH COUPLING WITH QUICK JOINT	<u>28.60</u>
229.	FORD 3/4" FSC-088-642 PIPE OD .875 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>41.05</u>
230.	FORD 3/4" FSC-105-6R2 PIPE OD 1.05 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>41.91</u>
231.	FORD 1" FSC-113-6R2 PIPE OD 1.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>41.34</u>
232.	FORD 1" FSC-132-6R2 PIPE OD 1.32 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>42.21</u>
233.	FORD 1 1/4" FSC-138-6R2 PIPE OD 1.375 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>42.11</u>
234.	FORD 1 1/4" FSC-166-6R2 PIPE OD 1.66 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>43.25</u>
235.	FORD 1 1/2" FSC-163-6R2 PIPE OD 1.625 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>42.62</u>
236.	FORD 1 1/2" FSC-190-6R2 PIPE OD 1.90 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>43.76</u>

BIDDER NAME: HO Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

237.	FORD 2" FSC-213-6R2 PIPE OD 2.125 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>43.75</u>
238.	FORD 2" FSC-238-6R2 PIPE OD 2.38 STAINLESS STEEL DUAL-ARMOR CLAMP	<u>45.41</u>
239.	FORD 6" FLSI-(6.35,6.96,7.24,7.75,7.85) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>137.59</u>
240.	FORD 8" FLSI-(8.35,8.94,9.39,9.67) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>167.21</u>
241.	FORD 10" FLSI-(10.10,11.04,11.44,11.74,12.15) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>227.05</u>
242.	FORD 12" FLSI-(12.40,13.02,13.50,13.80,14.10,14.40) X 15 STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP	<u>258.33</u>
243.	FORD PTB-BR PLASTIC AMR PLUG	<u>4.69</u>
244.	FORD PTB-BR-3-25 PLASTIC AMR PLUG	<u>20.83</u>
245.	W3BPO PLASTIC INNER LID	<u>No bid</u>
246.	W3PD PLASTIC INNER LID	<u>No bid</u>

BIDDER NAME: HO Supply Waterworks, Ltd.